CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS
ORDINANCE NO. 197

AN ORDINANCE REGULATING BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION PRACTICES AND
REGULATING AND CONTROLLING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF
MATERIAL, ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION,
RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF
PROPERTY, BUILDINGS, AND STRUCTURES AND TO PROVIDE FOR SUPPLIED
UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTHER PHYSICAL THINGS AND CONDITIONS
ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY, AND FIT
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF
WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS; INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, EXCLUDING ALL
APPENDICES; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A.,B,,C.,D., E., J.,
AND K., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS F., G., H.,, AND |.; THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE INCLUDING APPENDIX
CHAPTER A., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTER B.; THE 2000 EDITION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, EXCLUDING ALL APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE
2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE EXCLUDING ALL
APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A, B., AND C., BUT EXCLUDING
APPENDIX CHAPTER D.; AND THE 1999 ED[TION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B., C. D., AND E.; WITH CERTAIN
OMISSIONS, CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO AND PRESCRIBING
ADDITIONAL REGULATIONS; PROVIDING CERTAIN PENALTIES; SUBSTITUTING
THE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES OF THE CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS
FOR THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; ESTABLISHING A
BOARD OF CODE APPEALS, AND THE MEMBERSHIP AND PROCEDURES
THERETO; ESTABLISHING CERTAIN STORM WATER AND DRAINAGE CONTROL
PROCEDURES; PROVIDING FOR CERTAIN FEES; ESTABLISHING THE
APPLICABILITY OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; AND REPEALING
CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS:

Section 1. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
document known as the "International Building Code" 2000 Edition, excluding all
Appendices, as published by the International Code



Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter
omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the International
Building Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No.
197." with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearly
marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of
this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the
public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in
another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or
recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The police
department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city charged with
enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of
official copies of such International Building Code similarly marked, as may be deemed
expedient.

Section 2. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE: The following sections of the
International Building Code shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1 shall be amended to read "These regulations shall be known as
the Building Code of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas."

2. Section 101.2 shall be amended to read : "Exception: Detached one- and two-
family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (fownhouses) not more than three
stories high with separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply
with the International Residential Code as amended."

3. Section 101.4.1. shall be amended to read: "The provisions of the National
Electrical Code shall apply fo the installation of electrical systems, including alterations,
repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances
thereto."”

4. Section 105.2. entitled "Work exempt from permit," shall be revised to and
amended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 13. under the sub-category
“Building” from the permit requirement. The requirement for a permit is further set forth
in section 5-103 of the Westwood Hills Municipal Code.

5. Section 105.3.2 shall be amended to read as follows: "An application for a
permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after
the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit
has been issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more
extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension
or extensions shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.”

6. Section 108.3, entitled "Building permit valuations," shall be amended to add
the following sentence at the end of said provision: "Alternatively, building permits fees

2



may be set and established administratively by the City according to the schedule as
established by the City and as amended.”

7. Section 113.4, entitled "Violation penalties,” shall be amended to add the
following at the end of said provision: .
In addition to any administrative remedies or other fegal or equitable remedies
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a
separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any
violation of any provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or
permitted by any such person.

8. Section 1612.3, entitled "Establishment of flood hazard area," shall be
deleted, and in lieu thereof, shall be inserted the following: "To establish flood hazard
areas, the City of Westwood Hills may adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. If
and when the city undertakes such a task, such shall comply with the requirements of
Section 1612.3 and shall be incorporated into the city's code requirements."

9. Section 3409.2, entitled "Applicability,” shall be amended so that the first
sentence thereof shall read: "Structures existing prior, to the date of adoption of this
code, in which there is work involving additions, alterations or changes of occupancy
shall be made to conform to the requirements of this section or the provisions of
Sections 3402 through 3406."

Section 3. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS. There is hereby
incorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating building and construction
practices and to provide for the public safety and welfare within the corporate limits of
the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain document known as the "International
Residential Code for One-and Two-Family Dwellings" 2000 Edition, excluding Appendix
Chapters F., G., H., and |. but including Appendix Chapters A., B., C., D., E., J., and K,
as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles,
sections, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No
fewer than three copies of the International Residential Code for One- and Two Family
Dwellings shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance
No.197." with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearly
marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of
this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and avaitable to the
public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in
another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or
recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The police
department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city charged with
enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of

3



official copies of such International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
Dwellings similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 4. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO--
FAMILY DWELLINGS. The following sections of the International Residential Code for
One- and Two-Family Dwellings 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section R101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read: "These provisions
shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of
the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, and shall be cited as such and will be
referred to herein as 'this code. "

2. Section R105.2, entitled "Work exempt from permit,” shall be revised and
amended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 9. under the sub-category
“Building” from the permit requirement. The requirement for a permit is further set
forth in section 5-103 of the Westwood Hills Municipal Code.

3. Section R305.1, entitled "Minimum height," shall be amended to amend only
the first sentence thereof to read as follows: "Habitable rooms, hallways, corridors,
bathrooms, toilet rooms, laundry rooms and basements shall have a ceiling height of
not less than 6 feet 8 inches.” Also, the subparagraph of Section R305.1, entitled
"Exceptions 3.," shall be amended to read as foliows: "Not more than 50% of the
required floor area of a room or space Is permitted to have a sloped ceiling less than 6
feet, 8 inches in height with no portion of the required floor area less than 5 feet in
height."

4. Section R201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes,” shall be amended to
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1998
National Electrical Code, International Buiiding Code, international Fire Code, the
International Fuel Gas Code, or the International Mechanical Code, such terms shall
have meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

5. Section R108.1, entitled "Building permit valuations," shall be amended to add
the following sentence at the end of said provision: "Alternatively, building permits fees
maybe set and established administratively by the City according to the schedule as
established by the City and as amended.”

6. Section R113.4, entitled "Violation penalties," shall be amended to add the
following at the end of said provision:

tn addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equitable remedies
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a

4



separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any
violation of any provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or
permitted by any such person.

7. Section 301.2, entitled "Climatic and geographic design criteria, shall be -
amended as follows: "The criteria herein shall be administratively established by the
building official and inserted herein."

Section 5. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
MECHANICAL CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
document known as the "International Mechanical Code" 2000 Edition, including
Appendix Chapter A., but excluding Appendix Chapter B., as published by the
International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or
portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three
copies of the International Mechanical Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy
as Adopted by Ordinance No. 197" with all sections or portions thereof intended to be
omitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which
shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to
inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however,
may be on a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that any changes or
amendments are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily
understood. The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments
of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied. at the cost of
the city, such number of official copies of such International Mechanical Code similarly
marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 6. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE. The following sections of
the International Mechanical Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read: "These regulations
shall be known as the Mechanical Code of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas,
hereinafter referred to as 'this code."

2. Section 106.5.2, entitled "Fee schedule," shall be amended to read as follows:
"The fees for mechanical work and the permits therefor shall be set and established
administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the City and as
amended.”

3. Section 106.5.3, entitled "Fee refunds," shall be amended to read as follows:
"The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy."

4. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to

5



read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are used in the
International Building Code, the National Electrical Code, the International Fire Code,
the International Fuel Gas Code, or the International Plumbing Code, such terms shall
have meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

5. Section 108.4, entitled "Violation penalties,” shali be amended to read as
follows:

Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any
of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, or repair mechanical
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code shall
be guilty of a violation of this code. In addition to any administrative remedies or
other legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions
of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500,
or be imprisoned not to exceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned.
Each person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day during
any portion of which any violation of any provision of the city ordinances is
committed, continued or permitted by any such person.

6. Section 108.5, entitled "Stop work orders,” shall be amended so that the final
sentence thereof shall read: "Any person who shall continue any work in or about the
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that
person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guiity of
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith.”

Section 7. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
FIRE CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating
building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and welfare
within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain document
known as the "International Fire Code™ 2000 Edition, excluding all Appendix Chapters,
as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles,
sections, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No
fewer than three copies of the International Fire Code shall be marked or stamped
"Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 187," with all sections or portions thereof
intended to be omitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or
change and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city
clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One
such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that
any changes or amendments are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so
as to be readily understood. The police department, municipal judge and all
administrative departments of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall
be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of official copies of such International
Fire Code similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.



Section 8. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. The following sections of the
International Fire Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read as follows: "These
regulations shall be known as the International Fire Code of the City of Westwood Hills,
Kansas, hereinafter referred to as 'this code.”

2. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes,"” shall be amended to
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999
National Electrical Code, International Building Code, the International Fuel Gas Code,
International Mechanical Code, or International Plumbing Code, such terms shall have
meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

3. Section 105.1, entitled "Permits required," shall be amended to add a final
sentence as follows: "The fees for this code and the permits therefor shall be set and
established administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the
City and as amended."

4. Section 109.3, entitled "Prosecution of violations," shall be amended to add
the following:

In addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equitable remedies
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a
separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any
violation of any provision of the city ordinances is commitied, continued or
permitted by any such person.

5. Section 111.4, entitled "Failure to comply,” shali be amended to read as
follows: "Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation
or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a violation of this code, and punished in
accordance herewith."

6. Section 3406.2 4.4, entitled "Locations where above-ground tanks are
prohibited," shall be amended to read: "The storage of Class | and li liquids in above-
ground tanks is prohibited anywhere in the city, except that a permit for such tanks may
be granted by the Governing Body upon good cause shown and assurances by all
competent sources that such tank poses no unreasonable threat or danger to persons
or property."

Section 9. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
PLUMBING CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of

7



regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
document known as the “International Plumbing Code" 2000 Edition, excluding all
Appendix Chapters, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and
except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted,
modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the International Plumbing Code
shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 197," with all
sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearly marked to show
any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance,
and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all
reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in another
electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or recorded
in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The police department,
municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city charged with enforcement
of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of official copies
- of such International Plumbing Code similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 10. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE. The following sections of the
International Plumbing Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shaill be amended {o read: "These regulations
shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of the City of Westwood Hills,
Kansas, hereinafter referred to as 'this code.™

2. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999
National Electrical Code, international Building Code, International Fire Code, the
International Fuel Gas Code, or the International Mechanical Code, such terms shall
have meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

3. Section 106.6.2., entitled "Fee schedule," shall be amended to read as
follows: "The fees for all plumbing work and the permits therefor shall be set and
established administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the
City and as amended."

4. Section 106.6.3., entitled "Fee refunds,"” shall be amended to read as follows:
"The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy."

5. Section 108.4, entitled "Violation penalties," shall be amended to read as
follows:

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with
any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, or repair
plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of

8



the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this
code shall be guilty of a violation of this code. In addition to any administrative
remedies or other legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the
provisions of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to
exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed six months or be both so fined and
imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every
day during any portion of which any violation of any provision of the city
ordinances is committed, continued or permitted by any such person.

6. Section 108.5, entitied "Stop work orders," shall be amended so that the final
sentence thereof shall read: "Any person who shall continue any work in or about the
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that
person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith."

7. Section 305.6. 1., entitled "Sewer depth,” shall be amended to read as follows:
Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a minimum of
36 inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank connection. Building sewers
shall be constructed in accordance with the requirements of Johnson County
Wastewater.

8. Section 904. 1, entitled "Roof extension,” shall be amended to read as follows:

All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated at least 18 inches
above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than
weather protection, the vent extension shali be run at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above
the roof.

Section 11. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
FUEL GAS CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
document known as the "International Fuel Gas Code" 2000 Edition, including
Appendix Chapters A., B, and C._, but excluding Appendix D., as published by the
International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or
portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three
copies of the International Fuel Gas Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as
Adopted by Ordinance No. 197 " with all sections or portions thereof intended to be
omitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which
shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to
inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however,
may be on a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that any changes or
amendments are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily
understood. The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments
of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of

9



the city, such number of official copies of such International Fuel Gas Code similarly
marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 12. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE. The following sections of the
International Fuel Gas Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read: "These regulations
shall be known as the International Fuel Gas Code of the City of Westwood Hills,
Kansas, hereinafter referred to as 'this code.™

2. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999
National Electrical Code, International Building Code, International Fire Code,
International Mechanical Code, or International Plumbing Code, such terms shall have
meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

3. Section 106.5.2, entitled "Fee schedule,” shall be amended to read as follows:
"The fees for all work pursuant to this code and the permits therefor shall be set and
established administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the
City and as amended.”

4. Section 106.5.3., entitled "Fee refunds,"” shall be amended to read as follows:
"The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy."

5. Section 108.4., entitled "Violation penalties,” shall be amended to read as
follows:

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with
any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, or repair work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official,
or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code shall be guilty
of a violation of this code. In addition to any administrative remedies or other
legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions of this
code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be
imprisoned not to exceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each
person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day during any
portion of which any violation of any provision of the city ordinances is
committed, continued or permitted by any such person.

6. Section 108.5 entitled "Stop work orders,” shall be amended so that the final
sentence thereof shall read: "Any person who shall continue any work 'in or about the
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that
person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith."

10



Section 13. INCORPORATING THE 1999 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL
ELECTRICAL CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
document known as the "National Electrical Code" 1999 Edition, including all Appendix
Chapters A., B., C., D., and E., as published by the National Fire Protection
Association, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are
hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the
National Electrical Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by
Ordinance No. 197," with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or
changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be
attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection
and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on
a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments
are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood.
The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city
charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city,
such number of official copies of such National Electrical Code similarly marked, as
may be deemed expedient.

Section 14. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE. Wherever reference is made to the International Property
Maintenance Code in any of the aforementioned codes, there shall be substituted
therein "all property maintenance codes of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas."

Section 15. PENALTIES. Unless a penalty provision is otherwise provided for in
any of the above codes, in addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or
equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions of these codes shall,
upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to
exceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a
separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any violation of
any provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or permitted by any such
person. »

Section 16. APPEAL; BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ESTABLISHED.

Section 1. BOARD OF CODE APPEAL S ESTABLISHED. There is hereby
established and created a Westwood Hills, Kansas "Board of Code Appeals. This shall
succeed to the duties and responsibilities of the Board of Structural Appeals previously
established.

Section 2. SAME; MEMBERSHIP. The board shall consist of three members to
be appointed by the mayor and with the consent of the governing body. The members
first appointed shall serve for terms of one, two and three years. Thereafter, members
shall be appointed for terms of three years each. Vacancies shall be filled by

11



appointments for the unexpired term. The members of the board shall serve without
compensation. In the absence of a duly appointed Board of Code Appeals, the City
Council shall serve as the Board of Code Appeals.

Section 3. SAME; POWERS AND DUTIES. The powers and duties of the Board
of Code Appeals shall be in accordance with the codes adopted by reference herein.

Section 17. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainage or
surface water requirements in the codes herein, under Federal law or regulation, or any
other code of the City of Westwood Hills, any application for construction or additional
development of a property which in the building official's judgment may increase storm
water runoff and/or the possibility of erosion on adjoining properties shall require the
submission of a site plan with provisions for the containment and/or direction of any and
all additional runoff. All storm water runoff shall be contained or directed to a drainage
point on the same lot or property as the development occurs. No additional runoff may
be directed toward, or allowed to drain by lay of the land (or natural topography) on any
adjoining property or properties. Before the final inspection approval the building official
shall certify that drainage, storm water runoff and erosion requirements have been met.

Section 18. FEES. Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, a fee or fees
shall be charged for any permit under any of the codes herein and shall be subject to
the following: "The fees for all work pursuant to these codes and the permits therefor
shall be set and established administratively-by the City according to the schedule as
established by the City and as amended."

Section 19. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE 2000 ICC ELECTRICAL CODE
AND SUBSTITUTING THE 1999 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE THEREFORE.
Wherever reference is made to the 2000 ICC Electrical Code in any of the
aforementioned codes, there shall be substltuted therein "the National Electrical Code
1999 Edition."

Section 20. REPEAL AND SAVINGS CLAUSE. Sections 5-101 and 5-102 of
the Westwood Hills Municipal Code, 1994 Edition, are specifically repeaied and all
other ordinances inconsistent herewith are repealed; however the repeal of said
ordinances does not affect any right which has accrued, and duty imposed, any penalty
incurred, nor any proceeding commenced, under or by virtue of the ordinance repealed.
If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance (or any code
adopted thereby) is for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, unenforceable, or
otherwise void, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of
this ordinance. The City of Westwood Hills hereby declares that it would have passed
this ordinance (or any code adopted thereby), and each section, subsection, clause or
phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional, unenforceable, or
otherwise void. Further, nothing herein shall repeal or void any zoning, development, or
land use code or practice of the City.

12



Section 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force
from and after its publication in the official City newspaper.

+h
PASSED by the Council the 5 day of W , 2003.

1
APPROVED by the Mayor this £#_day of Md]i , 2003.

-
.. A l

E. Allen Roth, Mayor

ATTEST:

awna Samuel, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

13




RSN 4

The Legal Record

213 E. Santa Fe, Suite 2
Otlathe, KS 66061
(913) 780-5790

CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS
ATTN: SHAWNA SAMUEL
2004 w 50TH

WESTWOOD HILLS, KS 66205

Proof of Publication

STATE OF KANSAS, JOHNSON COUNTY, SS;
Maureen Gillespie, of lawful age, being first duly swom, deposes
and says that she is Legal Notices Billing Clerk of The Legal
Record which is a news r printed in the State of Kansas,

| published in and of general paid circulation on a weekly,

' monthly or yearly basis in Johnson County, Kansas, is nota

| trade, religious or fratemal publication, is published at least
weekly fifty (50) times a year, has been so published

| continuously and uninterrupted in said County and State for a

| ‘ period of more than one year prior to the first publication of the
notice attached, and has been entered at the post office as

Periodicals Class mail matter. That a notice was published

in all editions of the regular and entire issue for the following

subject matter (also identified by the following case number,

if any)

for consecutive week(s), as follows:
ORDINANCE NO. 197--5/20/03

Notary Public

PENNY KNIGHT
Notary Public - State of Kansas

My appointment expires: January 31, 2005.

ORD197

Publication Fees: $120.53

$120.53




CONTINUED FROM PRECEDING PAGE

Section 13. INCORPORATING THE 1999 EDITION.OF THE NATIONAL
EI.LECTRICAL CODE. There is hareby incorporated by reference for the purpose of
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
walfare within the corporate limits of the Clty of Wesitwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
ducument known as the "Nationat Electrical Code™ 1999 Edition, including all Appendix
Chapters A, B, C., D., and E., as published by the National Fire Protection
Association, inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are
hireafter omitted, deleted, modified or changad. No fewer than three coples of the
National Electrical Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by - -
Ordinance No. 187, with all sactions or portions thereof intended to ba omitted or
changed clearty marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be
attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection
and available to the public at all reasonabie hours. One such copy, however, may be on
a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments
are aftached to or recorded in such electronic forrnat so as to be readily understood.
The police depariment, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city
charged with enforcemant of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city,
such number of official copies of such National Electrical Code similarty marked, as
ray be deemed expedient.

Section 14. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE. Wherever referance is made to the Intemational Property
Maintenance Code in any of the aforementioned codes, there shall be substituted
trereln "all property maintenance codes of the City of Westwood Hilis, Kansas "

Section 18. PENALTIES. Unloss a panalty provision is atherwise provided for in
a1y of the above codes, in addition to any administrative ramedies or other tegal or -
ejuitable remedies provided, any persans violating the provisions of these codes shall,
udon conviction theredf, be fined in 8 sum not to exceed $500, of be imprisoneéd not to
ecceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a
stparate offense for sach and every day during any portion of which any viclation of
a7y provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or permitied by any such
parson.

B
Section 16. APPEAL; BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ESTABLISHED. '

Section 1. BOARD OF CODE APPEAL S ESTABLISHED. Thers is hereby
established and created 8 Westwood Hills, Kansag “Beard of Code Appeais. This shall
s jcoeed 1o the duties and responsibilities of the Board of Structural Appeals previously
established. : T

Section 2. SAME; MEMBERSHIP. The board shall congist of threa members to
te appointed by the mayor and with the consent of the goveming body. The members
first appointad shall garve for terms of one, two and three ysars. Theraafter, members
shall be appointed for tarms of three years each. Vacancies ghall ba filled by

i without
appointments for the unexpired term. The members of the board shall serve
efmpemétion. In the atsance of a duly appointed Board of Code App:eals_. the City
Cuncil shall serve as the Board of Code Appeals.

Section 3. SAME: POWERS AND DUTIES. The powers and duties of the Board
o Code Appeals shall be in accordance with the codes adopted by teferencs herein.

Section 7. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainags of
surface water requirements in the codes hereln, under Federal law or regulation, or any
orher code of the Clty of Westwood Hills, any application for construction or additional
davelopment of & property which In the bullding ofﬂcua]‘e judgment may increase storm
water runoff and/or the possibility of eroslon on adjoining properties shall require the

Section 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effact and be in force
from and aftar its publication in the official City newspaper.

- PASSED by the Counci! the_Sth day of Mgy , 2003.
APPROVED by the Mayor this §th day of May . 2003.

st E. Allep Roth
E. Aiten Roth, Mayor

ATTEST:
i 1
Shawna Samus!, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

IiE R
Fonald S. Reuter, City Attomey

& ibinission of a sits plan with provisions for the containment and/or direction of any and




) R C e e e eapou, O UK GO OT 1@ CItY,
such number of official copies of such National Electrical Code similarly marked, as
T ay be deemed expediont.

Section.14. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE. Wheraver referance is made to the Intemational Property
Naintenance Code in any of the aforementioned codes, there shall be substituted
terein "all property maintenance codes of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas. *

Section 15. PENALTIES. Uniess a penalty provision is otherwise provided for in
avy of the above codes, in addition to any administrative remodies or other logal or -
ejuitable ramedies provided, arny persans violating the provisions of thess codes shall,
uaon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to
e<casd six months or be both so fined and imprizoned. Each person shall be gullty of a
s*parate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any violation of

a7y provision of the city ordinancas s committed, continved or permitted by any such
parson.

Section 16. APPEAL; BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ESTABLISHED.

SauiontBOARDDFCODEAPPEALSESTABUSHED.TM'Bhemby
established and created a Westwood Hills, Kansas “Board of Code Appeats. This shall

8 cceed to the duties and responaibilities of the Board of Structural Appeals previously
esiablished. =P

Section 2. SAME; MEMBERSHIP. The board shall consist of three mermbers to
te appointed by the mayor ang with the consent of the goveming body. The members
first appointad shall serve for terms of one, two and three years. Thereafter, members

- shafl be appointed for terms of three years each. Vacancies shall be filled by

appointments for the unexpired term. The members of the board shall serve without
cumpensation. in the absence of a duly appointed Board of Code Appeals, the City
C >uncil shall serve as the Board of Code Appeals. . :

Section 3. SAME; POWERS AND DUTIES. The powers and duties of the Board
o1 Code Appeals shall be in accordance with the codes adopted by referance herain.

Section 17. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainage or
surface water requirements in the codes herein, under Federal law or regulation, or any
o her code of the City of Westwood Hills, any application for construction or additional
d-svelopment Of a property which in the building official’s judgment may increase storm
water runoff and/or the possibiiity of erasion on adjoining properties shall require the
s.ibinission of a gite plan with provisions for the containment and/or direction of any and
al additional runoff. All storm water runoff shall be contained or directed to a drainage
paint on the same lot or property as the development occurs. No additional runoff may
b2 directed toward, or allowed o drain by lay of the land {or naturs! topography) on any
adjoining property or properfies. Before the fina! inspection approval the building official

s1all certify that drainage, storm water nunoff'and erosion requirements have hesn met.

Section 18. FEES. Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, a fee or foes
shall be charged for any perfiit under any of the codes herein and shall be subject to
the following: “The fees for all work pursuant to these codes and the permits therefor
shatlt be set and established admiinistratively by the City according to the schedule as
established by the City and as amended.”

' Section 18. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE 2000 ICC ELECTRICAL CODE
£ND SUBSTITUTING THE 1989 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE THEREFORE.
Wherever reference is madé to the 2000 ICC Electrical Code in any of the
eforementioned codas, theére ghall be substituted therein “the National Electrical Code
999 Edition."” e

Section 20. REPEAL AND SAVINGS CLAUSE. Sections 5-101 and 5-102 of
te Wesitwood Hills Municipal Code, 1894 Edition, are spacifically repealed and afl
cther ordinances inconsistent herawith are repealed; however the repeal of said
ordinances does not affect any right which has accrued, and duty imposed, any penalty
i 1curred, nor any proceeding commenced, under or by virtue of the ordinance repealed.
I any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance (or any code
nidopted thereby) is for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, unenforceable, or
otherwise void, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of
this ordinance. The City of Westwood Hills hereby declares that it would have passed
this ordinance (or any code adopted thereby), and each section, subsection, clause or
phrase thereof, imespactive of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
nentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional, unenforceable, or
ntherwise void. Further, nothing herein shali repea) or void any zoning, development, or
tand use code or practice of the City.

Fonald S. Reuter, City Attormey




CONTINUED FROM PRECEDING PAGE

Section 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect and ba in force
from and after its publication In the official City newspaper. .

PASSED by the Council.the _6th day of May , 2003.
APPROVED by the Mayor this_81h day of May_, 2003.

E TR T,

David F. Patzman, Mayor
ATTEST:

il Shelley Greqory
Sielley Gregory, City Clerk .

A>PROVED AS TO FORM:

4+ Ropald . Reuter
Ronald S. Reuter, City Attomey

. NOTICE OF ABATEMENT
First published in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

First Published in The Legal Record oo Tuesday, May 20, 2003
CITY OF PRAIRIE VILLAGE, KANSAS
NOTICE OF ABATEMENT

This is official notice that the propertics located at:

OP44000004 0028 — LOT 28BLXK 4 - PRAIRIE HRIGHTS - 7908 MAPLE
OP44000005 0003 - LOT 3 BLK S PRAIRIE HEIGHTS -7911 MAPLE

OP55000053 0018 - LOT 15 BLK 53 — PRAIRIE VILLAGE - 5003 W. 70™ TERR -
OF251216 2023 ~BEGIN CTR 68™ STSW % W 165 NLY 151 W 110 S 136 E 110-4712 W. 68
OP11000000 0101 — LOT 101 - GRANTHURST - VACANT LOT - NO ADDRESS ON 71" TERR
OP25000035 0009 - LOT 9 BLK 15 - MEADOWLAKE - 2507 W. 77 ST

OP44000004 0022 - LOT 22 BLK 4 - PRAIRIE HEIGHTS - 7940 MAPLE

©OP42000010 0009 - LOT 9 BLK 10 - PRAIRIE FIELDS - 5309 W. 7s™ ST

. OP42000010 0011 - LOT 11 BLK 10 - PRAIRIE FIELDS - $801 W. 75™ ST

10, OP42000012 0001 — LOT | BLX 12 - PRAIRIB FIRLDS - 6225 W. 76™ ST

11. OPSS000018 0011 - LOT 11 BLK 18 — PRAIRIE VILLAGE ~ 4407 W. ¥ ST -

PENAA LN

Prairie Village, Kansas have weeds, grasses or other vegetation growth in violation of
Praine Viliage Municipal Code, Chapter 7.17; WEEDS, GRASSES OR OTHER
VEGETATION IN EXCESS OF EIGHT (8) INCHES. .

PERSONS OWNING OR OTHERWISE IN CONTROL OF SAID PROPERTIES ARE
HEREBY REQUIRED TO ABATE THE VIOLATION WITHIN TEN (10) DAYS
FROM THE DATE OF THIS NOTICE. Failure to comply with this notice will result in
the City arranging for the abatement of the violation by cutting or otherwise removing the
vegetation. Any costs to the City will be rssessed against the property OwDner or persons
in contro} of said property. Failure to pay within 30 days after abatement by the City will
result in the filing of a special assessment against the property. No additional notice will
be provided before the expiration of this notice. You may request a hearing regarding this
case by calling the Prairic Village Codes Deparnnent at 913-385-4605.

NOTICE: No further notice to cut the weeds or overgrown vegetation prior to its removal
by the City shall be given to you for the remainder of the calendar year.
CITY OF PRAIRIE VILLAGE CODES DEPARTMENT

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BID
First pubhshed in The Leq_al Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BID

aled proposals for the PUBLIC SAFETY FACILITY AND CITY HALL CCTV AND
SCESS CONTROL SYSTEMS AUDIO, VIDEO AND COMPUTER PRESENTATION
YSTEMS, in the City of Merriam, Kansas will be received from qualified bidders by the
ty of Merriam, Kansas at 9000 West 62™ Terrace, Marriam, Kansas 66202 until June
), 2003 at 4:00 p.m., at which time and place all bids will be publicly opened and read.

Yese projects encompass the furnishing and installation of audio, video and security
'mponents associated with the new Public Safety Facility and renovated City Hall.

'e Project Manual, consisting of the Bidding Documents may be examined at the office

the Community Development Director of Merriam, Kansas, 9000 West 62 Terrace,
erriam, Kansas 66202. The Project Manual may be obtained at Shaughnessy Fickel
Scott Architects, Inc., 1150 Grand Boulevard, Suite 400, Kansas City, MO 64106, for
10.00 per set {non-refundable).

ORDINANCE NO. 197
First published in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS
ORDINANCE NO. 197

A\

AN ORDINANCE REGULATING BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION PRACTICES AND

‘R EGULATING AND CONTROLLING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF
. MATERIAL,.ERECTION, INSTALLATION. ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION,

FELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF
FROPERTY, BUILDINGS, AND STRUCTURES AND TO PROVIDE FOR SUPPLIED
UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTHER PHYSICAL THINGS AND CONDITIONS
ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY, AND FIT
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF

" VIESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS; INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE 2000 -

EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, EXCLUDING ALL
APPENDICES; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A..B..C..D. E., 1,
AND K., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS F:, G, H., AND I.; THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE INCLUDING APPENDIX
CHAPTER A., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTER B.; THE 2000 EDITION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, EXCLUDING ALL APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE
2300 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE EXCLUDING ALL
APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B., AND C., BUT EXCLUDING
APPENDIX CHAPTER D.; AND THE 1989 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A, 8., C. D., AND E.; WITH CERTAIN
CMISSIONS, CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO AND PRESCRIBING
ADDITIONAL REGULATIONS; PROVIDING CERTAIN PENALTIES; SUBSTITUTING
THE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES OF THE CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS
FOR THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; ESTABLISHING A
BOARD OF COOE APPEALS, AND THE MEMBERSHIP AND PROCEDURES
T-ERETO; ESTABLISHING CERTAIN STORM WATER AND DRAINAGE CONTROL
PROCEDURES; PROVIDING FOR CERTAIN FEES; ESTABLISHING THE
APPLICABILITY OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; AND REPEALING
CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS:

Section 1. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE. There is hareby incorporated by refarence for the purpose of
re gulating bullding and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
w2lfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
dicument known as the "Intemational Building Code” 2000 Edition, excluding all
Appendices, as published by the Intermational Code ' :

Council, Inc., save and except such articlas, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter
cmitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the International
Fuilding Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No.
197" with all sactions or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearty
nmarked to show any such omission or changa and 1o which shalt be attached a copy of
this ordinance, and filed with the city cierk to be open to inspection and available to the

. public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in

another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are aftached to or
r:earded in such electronic format 6o as to be readily understood. The police
dapartment, munlicipal judge and all administrative departments of the city charged with
esforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of
official copies of such International Bullding Code similarty marked, as may be desmed
e qedient. ' Tl TG

Saection 2. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE: The following eections of the
Irternational Building Code shall be revised, amended, or deteted:

1. Section 101.1 shall be amended to read "These regulations shall bo known as
tt @ Building Code of the City of Westwoaod Hills, Kansas.”

2. Section 101.2 shall be amended to read : “Exception: Detached one- and two-
femily dwellings ang muitiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three
stories high with separate means of egress and their accessory structuras shall comply
with the International Residential Code as amended.” . .

_ 3. Section.101.4.1. shall be amended to read: "The provisions of tha National
E ectrical Code shall apply to the inctallation of electrical systemns, including alterations,
re pairs, replacament, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances
trereto.” -, :

4. Section 105.2. entitted "Work exempt from permit," ghall be revised ta and
ainended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 13. under the sub-category
“E.uilding” from the permit requirement. The requirement for a permit is further et forth
in section 5-103 of the Wastwood Hills Municipal Code.

S. Section 105.3.2 shall be amended to read as foliows: "An appiication for a
permit for any proposed work shall be deemed o have been abandoned 180 days after
the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a pemit
hus been issued; except that the building official is authornzed to grant one or more
eytensions of time for additionat periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension
or extensions shall be pquested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.”

6. Section 108.3, entitled "Building permit valuations,” shail be amended to add
tha following sentence at the end of said provision: “Altematively, building permits fees

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE

«
S

.

FS



CONTINUED FROM PFlECEDING PAGE

nidy be set and established adm:mstmtrveiy by the City aoootdlng to the echedula as
establmhed by the City and as amended.” .

7 Section 113.4, entitled ~Violation penalties.” shall be-amended to add Lhe
fnlfowmg at theo end of said provigion: :

In addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equhable remedies
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction.
"thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed
six months or be both 3o fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a
saparata offense for each and every day during any portion of which any
violation of any provision of the,city ordinances is commlﬁed contlnued or
permitied by any such person. .

. v -

8. Section 1612.3, entitled "Establishment of fiood hazard area," shall be
dsieted, and In lieu thereof, shall be inserted the following: “To establish flood hazard
a-eas, the City of Westwood Hills may adopt a fiood hazard map and euppertmg data. H
and when the city undertakes sucha task, such shall comply with the requlre‘ments of
Section 1612.3 and shall ba incorporated into the city's code requframents vl

8. Section 3409.2, entitied “Applicability,” shall be amended so mat the first
santence thareof shall read: "Structures existing prior to the date of adoption of this
cxde. in which there is work involving additions, alterations or changes of occupancy
shall be made to conform to the requirements of this section or the provuslons of
Secﬂons 3402 through 3408." s

" Section 3. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL

RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS. There is herety
-. Ircorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating building and construction

p ectices and to provide for the public safety and welfare within the corporate limis of
tr e City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain document known as the "Intemational
Residential Code for One-and. Two-Family Dwelings” 2000 Edition, excluding Appendix
Chapters F, G, H_, and I. but including Appendix Chapters A.,.B..C., D.. E., J., and K;
a1 published by the Intemational Code Council, Inc., gave nnd exaepl such arﬂcles.

" sactions, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, de!eted modified or changed. No
fe wer than three copies of the Intemational Residential Code for One- ,and Two Family
DOwellings shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance
N2.197." with all sections or portk)ne thereof intended 1o be omitied or changed thearty
arked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of |
this ordinanca, and filed will: (he city clerk to be open to Inspection and available to the
public at al reasonable hours. One such copy. however, may be on a CD-ROM or in
another elsctronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are atisched to or

. recorded in such elsctronic format so as to be readily understood. The police -
d::partment, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the ¢ity charged with
enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of

“¢ Hicial copies of such Intemational Residential Code for One- and Two-Family
[wellings simlilarly marked, as may be deemad expedient.
Section 4. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO-
f AMILY DWELLINGS. The following sections of the Intamational Resldenttal Code for
Cne- and Two-Family Dwellings 2000 Edition shall be revised, amanded., or deleted:

1. Section R101.1, entitied "Title," shall be amended to read: "These provisions -
shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of
the Clity of Westwood Hills, Kansas, and shall be cited as such and will be
referred to herain as 'this code. ' o . -

2. Section R105.2, entitied “Work exempt from pemmit” shall pe mbed and

_ amended to delets tha exemptions numbered 1. through 8. under the sub-category .

. “Building” from the permit requirement. Tha mquirement for a permit Is further set
forth in section 5-103 of the Westwood Hilis Municipal Code.

' 3. Section R305.1, entitied "Minimum hekght shall be amandad to amend only
“ the first sentence thereof to read as follows: “Habitable rooms. halhvays. oemdem.
bathrooms, toilet rooms, laundry rooms and basements shall have a ceiling. helghl of
not less than 8 feet 8 inches.” Also, the subparagraph of Section R305.1, entitied
"IZxcaptions 3.,” shall be amended to rasd as follows: “Not more than 50% of the
rquired floor area of a8 room of space is permitted to have, a sloped ceiling less than 6
tisel, 8 inchas in haght with no ponion of the required fioor area less than 5 foet in
halghl " \ Lt
4. Section R201.3, entitled *Terms defined in othar oodee.' shall be amended lo
mad as follows: “Where tarms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 19589
National Electrical Code, Intemational Building Code, intemational Fira Code, the
international Fuel Gas Code, or the Intarnational Mechanical Code, sueh terms shall
have meanings ascribed to them as in those codes.”" .

S. Section R108.1, entitied 'Bundmg permit vuluauons shall be amended to add
the following sentence at the end of said provision: "Alternatively, building pemmits fees
maybe sel and establishad administratively by lhe City aeeon!lng to |he echedu\e as
estabiished by the City and as amended.”

6. Section R1 13 4, entitled "Violation penaities,” shall be‘nmen'dad to add the
followmg al the end of said provision:

In addttion 1o any administrative remedies or other logal or equnable remedios

provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction

thereof, be fined In a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to excead

six months or be both so fined and Imprisoned. Each pemon &hall be guilty of a

LOAY TXDW A0 CIIVHITIOO

separats offense for each and every day during any portion of which any
violation of any provision of the city ordinances is oommatted continued or
permitted by any such pergon.

7- Saction 301.2, entitied “Climatic and geographic design criteria, shall be
amended as follows: "The criteria herein shall be admmmtrahve!y eatabllshed by the

~ bJilging oﬂic{al and msened herein.”

Soctlon 6. INCORPORAHNG THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNAHONAL
WMECHANICAL CODE. There Is hereby incorporated by reference for the purposa of
rogulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
d xcument known as the "Intemnational Mechanical Code™ 2000 Edition, inciuding
Appendix Chapter A., but excluding Appendix Chapter B., as published by the
Irtemationat Code Councll, Inc , save and except such articles, sections, parts or
pariions as are hersaftor omitted, deletad, modified or changed. No fewer than three
caples of the Intemational Mechanical Code shall be marked or stamped “Official Copy
a3 Adopted by Ordinance:No. 187" with all sactions or partions thereof intended to be
anitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which
s1all be attached a copy of this ordinance, and flled with the city clark to be open to
irspaction and available to the pubtic at all reasonable hours. One such capy, however,
may be on a CD-ROM or in another eiectronic form, provided that any changes or
anendments are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily

" understood. The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments

o' the city chargad with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of

" the city, such number of official copias of such Intemational Mechamcal Code similarty

mnrked as may be deemed expediant.

- Section e REVISED AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE. The following sections of
the Internaﬁenal Machanical Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1, Section 101.1, entitied ~Title,” shall be amended to read: These regulations

. shall be known as the Mechamml Code of the Clty of Westwood Hills, Kansas

hareinafter referrad to as 'this code ™

2. Section 108.5.2, entitled “Fee schedule,” shall be amended to read as faliows:
~he feas for machanical work and the permits therefor shall be sat and sstablished

- . .aJministratively by the Cn‘y according to the schedule as established by the City and as
" amended.”

3. Section 108.5.3, entitied "Fee refunds,” shall be amended to read as follows:
"he bmldlng ofﬁclal is authodzed te establish a mfund policy.”

s 6.

4 Sectlon 201. 3 entitied “Tarms deﬁned in othet codes,” shall be amended to

riad as follows: “Where terms are nat defined in thls code and are usod in the
Irternational Bullding Code, the Nationa! Elecirical Code, the Intamational Fira Cade,

- the Intamational Fuel Gas Code, of the international Plumbing Code, such 18rms shali

hava meaninge ascribed to them as In those codes.”

5. Section 108.4, entitled "Violation penalties," shell be amended to reed as
fellows: ) .

.- Persons who shall viclate a provision of this coda or shall fail to comply with any

of the requiremants thereof or who shall erect, install, atter, or repair mechanical
work in violation of the approved-construction dacuments or directive of the code
. official, or of a-pammit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code shall
be guilty of a violation of this code. in addltion to any administrative remedies or
other legal or equitable remadies provided, any persons violating the provisions
- of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500,
.or be Imprisoned not-tn.exceed six months or be both 8o fined and imprisoned.
Each parson shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day during
- any portionof which any violation of any provision of the city ordinances is
. commtted eentmuecl ar pamiited by any such parson.

°6. Section 108.5, entitied *Stop work orders.” shall be amendsd so that the final

-snntence thereof shall read: "Any person who shall continue any work in or about the

structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that
person Is directed to perform to remove a viclation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of

a vlolatlon of this code, and punlshed in aeoordance herewith.”

N S I S T .

. Soctlon 7. INCORPORATIHG THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL

FIRE CODE. There is hereby incorporatad by referonce for the purposa of raguisting

building and construction practicas and to provide for the public safaty and welfare

w thin the carporata limits of the City of Wastwood Hillg, Kanaas, that certain document
kriown as the "Intemational Fire Code® 2000 Edition, excluding all Appendix Chapters,
as: published by the Intemational Code Counll, Inc., save and except such articles,
sctions, parts or portions as are hareaftar omittad, deleted modified or changed. No

" fewar than three copias of the Intemational Fire Code shall be marked or stamped ..

"(Mfficlal Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 167," with all sections or portions thereof
intanded to be omitted or changad clearty marksd to show any such omigsion or
change and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city
¢lark to be open 1o Inspeciion and available to the public at all reagonable hours. One
such copy, however, may be on a CO-ROM or in ancther clectrenic form, provided that
any changes or amendments are attached to or recorded in such alactromc format so
= {0 be readily undemtood. The police depariment, municipal judge and all

admlnlstmﬂve depariments of the city chamged with anforcameant of the ordinance shall

-bar supplied, at the cost of the city, such numbaer of official coples of euch Intamational

F|re Cede enrmlaﬁy marke«d as may be deemed expedient
S " CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE




CONTINUED FROM PRECEDING PAGE

Section 8. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. The following sections of the
Irtermational Fire Code 2000 Edltlon shall be revised, amended, or daleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitied “THle," shall be amendod to read as follows: "These
regulations shall bo known as the International Frro Code of the Chy of Westwood Hills,
Kansas, heminamr mfon'od to as 'this code.™

W P ) l .

2. Section-201.3, enﬂﬂod “Terms defined In other codes,” shall be amended to
read as follows: 'Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999
National Electrical Code, International Building Code, the International Fuel Gas Code,
Irtemationsl Mechanical Code, or Intemational Plumbmg Code, such terms lhall have
m eanings ascribed to them as in those codes." .

3. Section 105.1, entitied "Permits required.” shall be amended to add a final
santenca as follows: "The faes for this cods and the permits therefor shall be set and
established administratively by the City according to the ochodule as utabllshed by the
Cty and as amendad.”

4. Saction 109.3, entitied "Prosecution of violations,” shall be amendod to add
the lollowlng

In m!diﬁon to any adminigtrativa remadies or othar lagal or equitable remedies
provided, any parsons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be Imprisonad not to exceed
six months or be both 80 fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a
saparate offense for each and every day dunng any portion of which any
violation of any provision of the city on'ilnanuaa B committed, continued or
permitied by any such parson.

5. Section 1114, entitled “Failure to cornply * shall be amended to read as
follows: "Any person who shalt continue any work after having been served with a stop
wrk order, except such work as that person Is-directed to parform to ramove a violation
ol unsafe condiion, shall be guilty of a violation of this code, and punished In
arcordance herewith.”

6. Section 3406.2.4.4., entitiad "Locations where round tanks are
piohiblted.” shall be amended to read: “The storage of Class ! and Il kquids In above-
ground tanks is prohibited anywhere in the city, except that a permit for such tanks may
” b granted by the Goveming Body upon good cause shown and assurances by all
ctmpemrr;; sources that such tank poses no unreasonable threat or danger to persons
of property.”

Section 0. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL.
PLUMBING CODE. There Is hareby incorporated by reference for the purpose of

regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
wslfare within the corporate limits of the City of Wastwood Hllls, Kansas, that certain
document known as the “Intemational Plumbing Code” 2000 Edltlon, excluding ail
‘Aspendix Chapters, as published by the Intemational Code Council, Inc., save and
excepl such articles, sections, parts or porbons 88 are hereafter omitted, deleted, .
i odified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the Intemational Plumbmg Code
.shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 197,” with all
sactions of portions thereof Intended to be omitted or changed clearly marked to show
any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance,
and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all
reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on 8 CD-ROM or in another
elsctronic fonn, provided that any chanpes or smendments are ettached to or recorded
in such electronic format 3o as to be readily understood. The police depariment,
municipal judge and al administrative departments of the city chargad with anforcement
o! the ordinance ehall be suppliad, at the cost of the city, such number of official copies
o' such Intemational Plumbing Code similarly marked, as may be deamed expediant.

Section 10. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE. The following sections of the
Intamational Plumbing Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amendad, or deleted:

1. Section 101:1, entitled "Titte,” shall be amended to read: “These regulations
shall be known as the Intamational Plumbmg Gode of the City of Westwood Hllls
K anssas, hereinafter refarred to as ‘this: code

ER B el

2. Saction 201.3, entliad “Terms daﬁned in athor codee. shall be amondod to
read as follows: "Whare terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1699
National Electrical Code, imternational Buikling Code, Intemational Fire Code, the
Intsmational Fuel Gas Code, or the iIntamational Mechanical Code, such torma shall
hitve meanings ascribed to them as In those: eodoa

3. Section.106.8.2., entitied "Fee schedu)e shall be amended to read as
fcliows: “The fees for all plumbmg work and the permits therefor shall be set and
evtablishad administratively by the City aceording to the echedule as established by the
C 1y and as amended."

4. Section 1068.8.3., entitied "Fee refunds.” shall be amended to read as foliows:
"The building official Is authorized to establish a.refund policy.”

5. Section 108 .4, entitied “Violation penalties,” §hall be amended to read as
follows:

Any parson who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with '
, any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, Install, altst, or repair
plumblng work In vlolatlon of the approved oonstmdion documents or directive of

the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this
code shall be guilty of a violation of this code. In additlon to any administrative
remedies or other legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the
provisions of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to
exceod $500, or be imprisonad not to exceed six months or be both so fined and
imprisoned. Each person shall be guilly of a separate offense for each and every
day during any portion of which any violation of any provision of the city

N ortﬂnanoee is committed, continued or permft!ed by any such person.

6. Section 108.5, entitled "Stop work orders " ghall be amended so that the final
sentence thereof shall read: "Any person who shall continue any work in ar about the
st-ucture after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that
purson is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of
a violation of this coda, and punished in accordance herewith.”

7. Section 305.8. 1., entitled "Sewar dapth," shall be amended to raad as follows:
Bultding sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a minimum of
i inches below finished grade at the point of saptic tank connection. Bullding sewers
shall be constructed in accordance with the mqulramenta of Johnson County
Wastewater. . !

8. Sectibn 804. 1, entitled "Roof extension,” shall be amended to read as follows.

All opan vent pipes that extend through a rocf shall be terminated at least 18 inches

above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpoge other than

weathar prmocﬁon the vent extension shall be run at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above
- the roof. -

Section 11, INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
FUEL GAS CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
‘whifare within the corparate limits of tho City of Wastwood Hills, Kansas, that cartain

- document known:as the “Intemational Fuel Gas Code® 2000 Edltion, including

Appendix Chapters A., B., and C., but excluding Appendix D., as published by the
Intemational Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sectians, parts or

purtions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three

cupies of the Intamational Fusl Gas Code shall be marked or stamped “Official Copy as
Adopied by Ordinance No. 187" with all sections or portions thereot Intended to be

" omitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which

st all be attached & copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to
‘inspaction and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however,
may be on a CD-ROM or In another elactronic form, provided thal any changes or
‘arnandmenta are attached to or recorded In such oloctromc format 80 ae to be readily.
understood. The police department, municipal judge and alt administrative departments
of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of

tha city, such number of official copies of such Intemational Fuel Gas Code similarty
marked, as may be deemed expedient. !

Section 12. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE. The following sections of the

_ Intemational Fuel Gas Code 2000 Edftion 'ehaﬂ\be revised, amended, or defated:

1. Section 101.1, entitied *Titls,” shall bea amended to read: "These ragulations
shall be known as the Intamational Fuel Gas Code of the City of Westwood Hills,
Kansas, hersinafter referred to as ‘this code.™

2. Section 201.3, entitisd “Terms defined in other codes,” shall be amended to
read as follows: “VVhers terms are not defined in this code and are defined In the 1999
National Elactrical Code, Intemnational Bullding Code, international Fire Code,
International Machanical Code, or International Plumbing Coda, such terms shall have
maanings ascribed to them as in those codes.”

3. Saction 106.5.2, entitled "Fee schedule,” ghall be amended to raad as follows:
"The tees for all work pursuant to this code and|tha pamnits tharefor shali be set and
established administratively by tha City according to the schedule as established by the
City and as amended.”

4. Section 106.5.3., entitied "Fes refunds,” shall be amended to read as follows:
"The buiiding official is authorizad to establish al refund policy.* .

5 Section 108 4., entitled “Violation panalhu shall be amended to read as
follows:

Any person who shalt vrolats a provision df this code or shall fail to comply with
any of the requiraments thareof or who shall erect, Install, alter, or repair work in
violation of the approved construction documoms of directive of the code official,
or of @ permit or certificate [ssued under ;ho provigions of this code shall be guilty
of a violation of this coda. In addition fo any administrattve remedies or other
legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions of this
code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be
Imprisonad not to excead six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each
person shall be guilty of a separate offenss for each and every day during any
portion of which any violation of any provision of the city ordinances is
committed, continued or permitted by any auch person. .

6. Section 108.5 entitied "Stop work orders,” shall be amended so that the final
sontance thereof shall read: “Any person who shall continue any wark ‘in or about the
st-ucture after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that
peirson is directad to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guiity of
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith.” \

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



-

8action 13. INCORPORATING THE 1999 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL
EI.ECTRICAL CODE. There is hereby Incorporated by reference for the purpose of
regulating bullding and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and -
walfare within the oorporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that oertain
document known as the "National Electrical Code™ 1909 Edition, Including all Appendix
Chapters A, B, C., D., and E., as pudlished by the Nationa! Fire Protection
A:sociation, Inc., save and except such articies, sections, parts or portions as are
haresfter omitted, deleted, modified or changad. No fewer than three coples of the
N ational Elsclrical Code shall be marked or-stamped "Official Copy as Adoptad by
Odinance No. 197," with all sactions or portions thereof intanded to be omitted or
changed ciearly rmarket to show any such Omission or chanhge and to which shall be
attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk tn be open to inspection
and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on
a CD-ROM or.in another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments
aie attached to or recorded In such electronic format $o as to.be readily understood.
The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city
charged with enforcamant of the ordinance shali be supplied, at tha cost of the city.
such number of official copies of such National Electrical Code similarly marked, as
Ir ay be deemad expediant. ' '

Section 14. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY
MAINTENANCE CODE. Wherever referance is mada to the Intemational Property
Maintenance Cods in any of the aforamentioned codes, there shall be substituted
terein “all property maintenance codes of the City of Weatwood Hilis, Kansas.”.

Section 18, PENALTIES. Unloss a penalty provision is otherwise provided for in
a of the above oodes, in addition to any administrative ramedies or ather lagal or
ojuiable remedies provided, any persans violating the provisions of these codes shall,
u2on conviction theraof, be fined in a8 aum not to exceed $500, or be Imprisoned not to
e«cead six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of.a
ssparate offense for each and evary day during any portion of which any violation of
a1y provision of the city ordinancas s committed, continued or permitted by any such
parson. : .

Seotion 16. APPEAL; BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ESTABLISHED.

‘Saction 1. BOARD OF CODE APPEAL S ESTABLISHED. There is hereby -
established and created a Weatwood Hills, Kansas "Board of Code Appeals. This shall
em h:’ the duties end responaiblilties of the Board of Structural Appeals previously
e ; ‘ - L

Section 2. SAME; MEMBERSHIP. The board ehall consist of three membars to
be appointad by the mayor and with the consent of the gaoverning body. The members
firat appointed shall garve for terms of one, two and three ysars. Theraafter, members
shall be appointad for terms of three years each. Vacancies shall be fillsd by

appointments for the unexpired tenm. The mambers of the buard shall serve without
crempenaation. In the absance of a duly appointad Board of Code Appeals, the City
C suncil shall serve as the Board of Code Appeals. :

Section 3. SAME; POWERS AND DUTIES. The powers and duties of the Board
o Code Appeals shall be in accordance with the codes adopted by reference herein.

Section 17. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainage or
surface water raquirements In the codes herein, under Federal law o regulation, or any
o har code of the City of Westwood Hills, any application for construction or additional
d-svelopment of a property which In the building official’s judgment may increase storm
watar runoff end/or the possibliity of eroalon on adjoining properties shall require the |
& ibfnisslon of a site plan with provisions for the containment and/or direction of any and
ai additional runoff. All storm water runoff shall be contained or directad to a drainage
paint on the same Iot or property as the devalopment occurs. No additional runoff may
b3 directed toward, or allowed to drain by lay of the land (or natural topography) on-any -
adjoining property or propaeifies. Before the final Inspection approval the building official

s4all certify that drainage, storm water runoff and erosion raquiremants. have besn met.

Saction 18. FEES, Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, a fee or fees
shali’'be charged for any parhit under any of the codes herein and shall be subject to
the following: "The fees for ail work pursuant to these codes and the permits therefor
sha!l be set and established adminisiralively by the Clty according to the achadule as
established by the City and as amended.”

Section 19. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE 2000 ICC ELECTRICAL CODE
#ND SUBSTITUTING THE 1999 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE THEREFORE.
" \Wherever reference Is made to the 2000 ICC Electrical Code in any of the
s{orementioned codes, tharb ghall be substituted therein “the National Electsical Code
* 999 Edition.” L . .
Soction 20. REPEAL AND SAVINGS CLAUSE. Sections 5-101 and 5-102 of
t e Westwood Hills Municipal Code, 1994 Edition, are spacifically repeaied and all
ciher ordinances inconsistant harawith are ropealsd; however the repaeal of said
ordinances does nat affect any right which has accnued, and duty imposed, any penalty
icurrad, nor any prooseding commenced, under or by virtue of the ordinance repealed.
I any section, subsaction, santance, clause or phrase of this ordinance (or any code
adopted thereby) is for any reason, held to be unconstitutional; unenforceable, or
utherwise void, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of
this ordinance. The City of Westwood Hills hereby declares that It would have passed
1his ordinance (or any code adopiad thereby), and each section, subsection, clause or
phrase theraof, imespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsactions,
santencas, clauses and phrasea ba deciared unconstitutional, unenforceable, or
ntherwise void. Furthar, nothing heraln shall repeat or void any zoning, devalopment, or
‘and use code or practice of the Clty.

10 L R R E TR L I [P

S S RO T VU N T

8ection 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effact and be in force
from and after Its publication in the officiel City newspaper.

PASSED by the Council the_§th day of May , 2003.
APPROVED by the Mayor this_5th day of_Mey , 2003.

Jfaf E_Allen Both
C s E. Allen Roth, Mayor s
K

ATTEST: Tt Ve o S ATEVRE Ik I N R A3
- . .

{s{ Shawna Samupl . __
Shawna Samuel, City Clerk
APPROVED AS TO FORM:

I 5. Routs| ——
Fonald 8. Reuter, City Attormey

" KANSAS, this 14™ day of May 2003.

ORDINANCE NO. 1076
Flrsllpublrshed in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

. .CITY OF MISSION .
ORDINANCE NO. 1076

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER XVI, ARTICLE 1, SECTION 102
MEMBERSHIP, AND SECTION 103, TERMS OF OFFICE, OF THE CODE
OF THE CITY OF MISSION, KANSAS IN ORDER TO ALLOW FIVE AT
LARGE MEMBERS ON THE CITY OF MISSION PLANNING

COMMISSION. '

P

' ARTICLE 1. CLTY PLANNING COMMISSION .

16-102. MEMBERSHIP. The Planning Commission shall consist of nine members, one of
whom may be a nonresident of the City. At least one (1) member shall be fram eaci
ward and.no ward may have more than three (3) members.

16-103. TERMS OF OFFICE. The mayor, with the consent of the councll shall appaint ii
- members of the Planning Commission. Members shall be appointed for-terms.of t.
years each except as otherwise hereln provided. "Vacancies shall be fliled” -
appointment for the unexpired term only. The number of members may not -

. reduced unless a vacancy exists or unless the reduction takes effect at the end of
‘term. Members of thé Planning Commission-shall be appointed at the first regu!
meeting of the governing body in September. Members shell serve witho
compensation. .

PASSED AND APPROVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MISSION,

c APPRO‘./Eb BY THE MA\"OR OF THE CITY OF MISSION, KANSAS, this 14"

day of May 2003. ‘ .
| . . CITY OF MISSION
. ' 1 |
. ) Laura L. %cCOnwe;l, Mayor
ATTEST: )

-

Cheri L. Williams, Deputy City Clerk

The City of Leawood Pianning Commission will hald a public hearing on Tuesday. June 10, 200:
at 6:00 p.m. at the Laawood City Hall, Councit Chambers. 4800 Town Cenler Drive, Leawood,
Kanaag, 10 consider approval of an amendmant to the Leawood Development Ordinance on
saction 16-2-8.1, Plannéd Recreation.

NOTICE OF HEARING

First published in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.
NOTICE OF HEARING

if you require any accommodation (j.e. qualified interprater, hearing assistance, etc.) in order to
attend this meeting, piease nolify this office al (313} 338-8112 no later than 48 hours prior 1o the
scheduled commencement of the meeting.

J. Paul Duffendack, Chaimarson
Leawood Planning Cammission .




CONTINUED FFIOM PRECEDING PAGE

may be sal and established admlnwtrat!voty by the City awordlng to the sohedule as’
established by the City and as amended." l

7. Section 113.4, entitiad ’Volation penaltles.” shall be amondod to add the ,-
followming at the ond of said provigion:

'in addition 10 any adminigtrative remedies or other lagal or equitable remedies
provided. any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction
thereof, be fined in a sum not to oxceed $500, or be imprisoned net to exceed

six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a

separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any

violation of any provision of the city ordinances Is committed, continued or
permitted by any such person.

8. Section 1612.3, entitled "Establishment of flood hazard area," shal be
dsieted, and In liou thereof, shall be inserted the following: "To astablish ficod hazard
a‘ess, the City of Westwood Hills may adopt a flood hazard map and supparting data. H
and when the city undertakes such a.task, such shall comply with the requirements of -
Section 1612.3 and shall ba Incorporated into the city's code requirements.” . -

8. Section 3408.2, entitled "Appiicability.* shall be amended 80 that the first
s-3ntence thereof shall read: "Structures existing prior to the date of adoption of this
cde, in which there is work involving additions, alterations or changes of occupancy
shell be made to conform to the requ:romenls of this section or the provislons of
Sections 3402 through 3408.”

Section 3. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS. There is hereby
ircorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating building and construction -
p-uctices and to provide for the public safety and welfare within the corporate limits of
tt'e City of Westwood Hills, Kangas, that certain document known as the “intemational
Residential Code for One-and Two-Family Dwellings* 2000 Edition, excluding Appendix
Chapters F., G., H., and |. but including Appendix Chaplers A., B.,C., D., E., J., and K,
a3 publlshod by the Intemational Code Council, Inc., save ancl exoep! auch anlcles
soctions, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, delaied modified or changed. No
fe wer than three coples of the Intemationat Residentiat Code for One- and Two Family
Dwellings shall be marked or stamped “Official Copy as Adopted by Ordiriance
N>.197," with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed ctearty
marked 10 show ony such omission or change and to which shall be attachsd a copy of
tHis ordinance, and filed with {he cily clerk to be open to Inspection and available to the
public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM orin
another slectronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are atteched to or
recorded in such electronic format so as to be readity understood. The police - - -
de:partment, municipal judge and ali administrative departments of the city charged with
enforcement of the oniinaneg shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of

fficial copies of such International ﬁeaidentiai Code for One- and Two-Family
wellings similarly marked, as may be deemad expedient.

Section 4. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
-DITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO-
AMILY DWELLINGS. The foliowing sactions of ths Intemational Residenttal Code for
no- and Two-Family Dwellings 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section R101.1, entitled "Title,” shall be amended to read: "These provisions
shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of
the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, and shall be cttod as such and will be
re!erred to herein as 'this code. ™ )
2hn
" 2. Section R105.2, antitied “Work exempt from pennft.’ shall be revised and *
amended to delets the exemptions numbered 1. through 8. under the sub—category
“Building” from the permit requirement. The requirement for a permit is further set
forth in section 5-103 of the Westwood Hills Municipal Code. ..
" 3.Section R305.1, entitied "Minimum height,” shall be amended t6 amend onty
he first gentence thereof to read as follows: "Habitable rooms, hallways, cormridors,
1athrooms, toilet rooms, laundry rooms and basements shall have a ceiling height of
10t less than 6 feet 8 Inches.” Also, the subparagraph of Section R305.1, entitled
"=xcaptions 3.," shall be amended to read as follows: "Not more than 50% of the
nquired floor area of a room or spaca is permitied to have a sloped celiing lesa than 6
oet, 8 inches in haight with no portion of the mquired floor area less than 5 feet in
13ight.”

4. Section R201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes,” shall be amended ta
uad as follows: “Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined In the 1099
vational Electrical Code, International Buliding Code, International Fire Code, the
rternationa} Fuel Gas Code, or the International- Mechanlcal COcle such terms shall
1ave meanings ascribed to mom as in those codes." -

5. Section R108.1, entitled "Building permit vaiuations,” shall be amended o add
e following sentence at tha end of said provision: "Altamativaly, building permits fees
niaybe set and established administratively by the City according to the echedule as
»3tablished by the City and as amended.”

6. Sectnon R113.4, entitied "Violation penalties,” shall be amended to add the
cllowing at the end of said prov:suon

In addition to any administrative rernedies or othar legal or equitable remedies
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction
"thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed
six months or be both so fined and impriscned. Each perion shall be guilty of a

ADAS TXIV VO GEUKITUOD



ORDINANCE NO. 197
First published in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS
s ORDINANCE NO. 197

AN ORDINANCE REGULATING BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION PRACTICES AND
F EGULATING AND CONTROLLING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF
MATERIAL, ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION, . _
RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF
FROPERTY, BUILDINGS, AND STRUCTURES AND TO PROVIDE FOR SUPPLIED
.UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTHER PHYSICAL THINGS AND CONDITIONS
ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY, AND FIT
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF
WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS; INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, EXCLUDING ALL
APPENDICES:; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND
TWO-FAMILY. DWELLINGS INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B., C.,D.,E., 4.,
AND K., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS F., G., H., AND |.; THE 2000
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE INCLUDING APPENDIX
CHAPTER A., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTER B.; THE 2000 EDITION OF
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, EXCLUDING ALL APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE
2700 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE EXCLUDING ALL
APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B., AND C., BUT EXCLUDING
APPENDIX CHAPTER D.; AND THE 1998 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A, B., C: D., AND E.; WITH CERTAIN
CMISSIONS, CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO AND PRESCRIBING
ADDITIONAL REGULATIONS; PROVIDING CERTAIN PENALTIES; SUBSTITUTING
T<E PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES OF THE CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS
FOR THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; ESTABLISHING A
BOARD OF CODE APPEALS, AND THE MEMBERSHIP AND PROCEDURES
THERETO; ESTABLISHING CERTAIN STORM WATER AND DRAINAGE CONTROL
PROCEDURES; PROVIDING FOR CERTAIN FEES; ESTABLISHING THE
ASPLICABILITY OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE: AND REPEALING
CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF
WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS:

Section 1. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL
BUILDING CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of -~
regulating bullding and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and
walfgre within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain
document known as the "International Buikding Code” 2000 Edition, excluding all
Appendices, as published by the intemational Code . .

Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hercafter
omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the International
Euilding Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No.
187," with all sactions or portions théreof Intended to be omitted or changed clearly.
marked to show any such omisaion or change and to which shaif be attached a copy of
this ordinance, and filed with the city cierk to be open to inspection and available to the
public at all reascnabie hours. One such copy, howsver, may be on a CD-ROM or in
another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments ars attached to or
recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The police
dapartment, municipal judge and ait administrative departments of the city charged with
e~forcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of
om!l cotpies of such Intemational Bullding Code similarly marked, as may be deemed
e en ' o

8ection 2. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000
EDlTlON OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE: The foliowing sections of the
Jrternational Building Code shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Sectiori 101.1 shall be amended to read “These regulations shall be known as
th e Building Code of the City of Westwoad Hills, Kansas.”

2. Section 101.2 shall be amended to read : “Exception: Detached one- and two-
fe mily_dwelllngs and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three
stories high with separats means of egress and their accassory structures shall comply
with the International Residential Code ag amended." . .

3. Section 101.4.1. shall ba amended to read: "The provisions of the National
E ectrical-Code shail apply to the installation of electrical systems, inciuding alterations,

gpai:s, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances
ereto.”

4. Section 105.2. entitied "Work exempt from pemmit.” shall be revised to and
Plngnqw to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 13. under the sub-category
Ewilding* from the permit requirement. The requirement for a permit is furthar set forth
In section 5-103 of the Wastwood Hills Municipal Code.

' 5. Section 105.3.2 shall ba amanded to read as follows: "An application for a
permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after
the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a pemit
hiis boon issued; excapt that the building official is authorized to grant one or more
ertansions of time for additionat periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension
or extensions shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstratad.”

6. §ection 108.3, entitled "Bullding permit valuations,” shall be amended to add
th3 following sentence at the end of said provision: “Atternatively, building permits fees

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE




CERTIFICATE

I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true and correct copy of the original
ordinance # /4“] ; that said ordinance was passed on the 5""’ day of

Miay , 2003 ; that the record of the final vote on its passage is
found in the minutes of the above mentioned date; that it was published in

the Aggga/ Kocord. on the day of ,

SEAL
Shawna Samuel
City Clerk

Wt aldo oppeaced r ZHe A oot




