
CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS

ORDINANCE NO. 197

AN ORDINANCE REGULATING BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION PRACTICES AND 
REGULATING AND CONTROLLING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION. QUALITY OF 
MATERIAL, ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, LOCATION, 
RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF 
PROPERTY, BUILDINGS, AND STRUCTURES AND TO PROVIDE FOR SUPPLIED 
UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTHER PHYSICAL THINGS AND CONDITIONS 
ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY, AND FIT 
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITY OF 
WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS; INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, EXCLUDING ALL 
APPENDICES: THE 2000 EDITION OF THE RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B„ C„ D., E., J.. 
AND K., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS F., G., H„ AND I.; THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE INCLUDING APPENDIX 
CHAPTER A., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTER B.; THE 2000 EDITION OF 
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, EXCLUDING ALL APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 
2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE EXCLUDING ALL 
APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS 
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B„ AND C„ BUT EXCLUDING 
APPENDIX CHAPTER D.; AND THE 1999 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL 
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B., C. D„ AND E.; WITH CERTAIN 
OMISSIONS, CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO AND PRESCRIBING 
ADDITIONAL REGULATIONS; PROVIDING CERTAIN PENALTIES; SUBSTITUTING 
THE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES OF THE CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS 
FOR THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; ESTABLISHING A 
BOARD OF CODE APPEALS, AND THE MEMBERSHIP AND PROCEDURES 
THERETO; ESTABLISHING CERTAIN STORM WATER AND DRAINAGE CONTROL 
PROCEDURES: PROVIDING FOR CERTAIN FEES; ESTABLISHING THE 
APPLICABILITY OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; AND REPEALING 
CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF 
WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS:

Section 1. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
BUILDING CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of 
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
document known as the "International Building Code" 2000 Edition, excluding all 
Appendices, as published by the International Code



Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter 
omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the International 
Building Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 
197," with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearly 
marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of 
this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the 
public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in 
another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or 
recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The police 
department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city charged with 
enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of 
official copies of such International Building Code similarly marked, as may be deemed 
expedient.

Section 2. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE: The following sections of the 
International Building Code shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1 shall be amended to read "These regulations shall be known as 
the Building Code of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas."

2. Section 101.2 shall be amended to read : "Exception: Detached one- and two- 
family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three 
stories high with separate means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply 
with the International Residential Code as amended."

3. Section 101.4.1. shall be amended to read: "The provisions of the National 
Electrical Code shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, 
repairs, replacement, equipment, appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances 
thereto."

4. Section 105.2. entitled "Work exempt from permit," shall be revised to and 
amended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 13. under the sub-category 
“Building” from the permit requirement. The requirement for a permit is further set forth 
in section 5-103 of the Westwood Hills Municipal Code.

5. Section 105.3.2 shall be amended to read as follows: "An application for a 
permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after 
the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith ora permit 
has been issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more 
extensions of time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension 
or extensions shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated."

6. Section 108.3, entitled "Building permit valuations," shall be amended to add 
the following sentence at the end of said provision: "Alternatively, building permits fees



may be set and established administratively by the City according to the schedule as 
established by the City and as amended."

7. Section 113.4, entitled "Violation penalties," shall be amended to add the 
following at the end of said provision;

In addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equitable remedies 
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction 
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed 
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a 
separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any 
violation of any provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or 
permitted by any such person.

8. Section 1612.3, entitled "Establishment of flood hazard area," shall be 
deleted, and in lieu thereof, shall be inserted the following: "To establish flood hazard 
areas, the City of Westwood Hills may adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. If 
and when the city undertakes such a task, such shall comply with the requirements of 
Section 1612.3 and shall be incorporated into the city's code requirements."

9. Section 3409,2, entitled "Applicability," shall be amended so that the first 
sentence thereof shall read: "Structures existing prior to the date of adoption of this 
code, in which there is work involving additions, alterations or changes of occupancy 
shall be made to conform to the requirements of this section or the provisions of 
Sections 3402 through 3406."

Section 3. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS. There Is hereby 
incorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating building and construction 
practices and to provide for the public safety and welfare within the corporate limits of 
the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain document known as the "International 
Residential Code for One-and Two-Family Dwellings" 2000 Edition, excluding Appendix 
Chapters P., G., H., and I. but including Appendix Chapters A., B., C., D., E., J., and K, 
as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles, 
sections, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No 
fewer than three copies of the International Residential Code for One- and Two Family 
Dwellings shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance 
No. 197," with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearly 
marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of 
this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the 
public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in 
another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or 
recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The police 
department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city charged with 
enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of

3



official copies of such International Residential Code for One- and Two-Family 
Dwellings similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 4. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TW O - 
FAMILY DWELLINGS. The following sections of the International Residential Code for 
One- and Two-Family Dwellings 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted;

1. Section R101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read: "These provisions 
shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-FamiJy Dwellings of 
the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, and shall be cited as such and will be 
referred to herein as 'this code.

2. Section R105.2, entitled "Work exempt from permit," shall be revised and 
amended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 9. under the sub-category 
“Building" from the permit requirement. The requirement for a permit is further set 
forth in section 5-103 of the Westwood Hills Municipal Code.

3. Section R305.1, entitled "Minimum height," shall be amended to amend only 
the first sentence thereof to read as follows: "Habitable rooms, hallways, corridors, 
bathrooms, toilet rooms, laundry rooms and basements shall have a ceiling height of 
not less than 6 feet 8 inches.” Also, the subparagraph of Section R305.1, entitled 
"Exceptions 3.," shall be amended to read as follows; "Not more than 50% of the 
required floor area of a room or space Is permitted to have a sloped ceiling less than 6 
feet, 8 inches in height with no portion of the required floor area less than 5 feet in 
height."

4. Section R201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to 
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999 
National Electrical Code, International Building Code, international Fire Code, the 
International Fuel Gas Code, or the International Mechanical Code, such terms shall 
have meanings ascnbed to them as in those codes."

5. Section R108.1, entitled "Building permit valuations," shall be amended to add 
the following sentence at the end of said provision; "Alternatively, building permits fees 
maybe set and established administratively by the City according to the schedule as 
established by the City and as amended."

6. Section R113.4, entitled "Violation penalties," shall be amended to add the 
following at the end of said provision:

In addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equitable remedies 
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction 
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed 
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a



separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any
violation of any provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or
permitted by any such person.

7. Section 301.2, entitled "Climatic and geographic design criteria, shall be • 
amended as follows: "The criteria herein shall be administratively established by the 
building official and Inserted herein."

Section 5. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of 
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
document known as the ’’Internationa! Mechanical Code" 2000 Edition, including 
Appendix Chapter A., but excluding Appendix Chapter B., as published by the 
International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or 
portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three 
copies of the International Mechanical Code shall be marked or stamped ’‘Official Copy 
as Adopted by Ordinance No. 197" with all sections or portions thereof intended to be 
omitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which 
shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to 
inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, 
may be on a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that any changes or 
amendments are attached to or recorded In such electronic format so as to be readily 
understood. The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments 
of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of 
the city, such number of official copies of such International Mechanical Code similarly 
marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 6. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE. The following sections of 
the International Mechanical Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read: "These regulations 
shall be known as the Mechanical Code of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, 
hereinafter referred to as 'this code."'

2. Section 106.5.2, entitled "Fee schedule," shall be amended to read as follows: 
"The fees for mechanical work and the permits therefor shall be set and established 
administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the City and as 
amended."

3. Section 106.5.3, entitled "Fee refunds," shall be amended to read as follows: 
"The building official Is authorized to establish a refund policy.”

4. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to

5



read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are used in the 
International Building Code, the National Electrical Code, the International Fire Code, 
the International Fuel Gas Code, or the International Plumbing Code, such terms shall 
have meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

5. Section 108.4, entitled ’Violation penalties,” shall be amended to read as 
follows:

Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any 
of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, or repair mechanical 
work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code 
official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code shall 
be guilty of a violation of this code. In addition to any administrative remedies or 
other legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions 
of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, 
or be imprisoned not to exceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. 
Each person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day during 
any portion of which any violation of any provision of the city ordinances is 
committed, continued or permitted by any such person.

6. Section 108.5, entitled "Stop wori< orders," shall be amended so that the final 
sentence thereof shall read: "Any person who shall continue any work in or about the 
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that 
person Is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of 
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith."

Section 7. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
FIRE CODE. There is hereby Incorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating 
building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and welfare 
within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain document 
known as the "International Fire Code" 2000 Edition, excluding all Appendix Chapters, 
as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles, 
sections, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No 
fewer than three copies of the International Fire Code shall be marked or stamped 
"Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 197," with all sections or portions thereof 
intended to be omitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or 
change and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city 
clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One 
such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or In another electronic form, provided that 
any changes or amendments are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so 
as to be readily understood. The police department, municipal judge and all 
administrative departments of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall 
be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of official copies of such International 
Fire Code similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.



Section 8. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. The following sections of the 
International Fire Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read as follows: "These 
regulations shall be known as the International Fire Code of the City of Westwood Hills, 
Kansas, hereinafter referred to as 'this code.'"

2. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to 
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999 
National Electrical Code, International Building Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, 
International Mechanical Code, or Internationa! Plumbing Code, such terms shall have 
meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

3. Section 105.1, entitled "Permits required," shall be amended to add a final 
sentence as follows: "The fees for this code and the permits therefor shall be set and 
established administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the 
City and as amended."

4. Section 109.3, entitled "Prosecution of violations," shall be amended to add 
the following:

In addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equitable remedies 
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction 
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed 
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a 
separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any 
violation of any provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or 
permitted by any such person.

5. Section 111.4, entitled "Failure to comply," shall be amended to read as 
follows: "Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop 
work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation 
or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a violation of this code, and punished in 
accordance herewith."

6. Section 3406.2.4.4., entitled "Locations where above-ground tanks are 
prohibited," shall be amended to read: "The storage of Class I and II liquids in above­
ground tanks is prohibited anywhere in the city, except that a permit for such tanks may 
be granted by the Governing Body upon good cause shown and assurances by all 
competent sources that such tank poses no unreasonable threat or danger to persons 
or property."

Section 9. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
PLUMBING CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of

7



regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
document known as the "International Plumbing Code" 2000 Edition, excluding all 
Appendix Chapters, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and 
except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, 
modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the international Plumbing Code 
shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 197," with all 
sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or changed clearly marked to show 
any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, 
and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all 
reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in another 
electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or recorded 
in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The police department, 
municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city charged with enforcement 
of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, such number of official copies 
of such International Plumbing Code similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 10. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE. The following sections of the 
International Plumbing Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read: "These regulations 
shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of the City of Westwood Hills, 
Kansas, hereinafter referred to as 'this code."'

2. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to 
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999 
National Electrical Code, International Building Code, International Fire Code, the 
International Fuel Gas Code, or the International Mechanical Code, such terms shall 
have meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

3. Section 106.6.2., entitled "Fee schedule," shall be amended to read as 
follows: "The fees for all plumbing work and the permits therefor shall be set and 
established administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the 
City and as amended."

4. Section 106.6.3., entitled "Fee refunds," shall be amended to read as follows: 
"The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy."

5. Section 108.4, entitled "Violation penalties," shall be amended to read as 
follows:

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with
any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, Install, alter, or repair
plumbing work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of



the code official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this 
code shall be guilty of a violation of this code. In addition to any adnninistrative 
remedies or other legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the 
provisions of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to 
exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed six months or be both so fined and 
imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every 
day during any portion of which any violation of any provision of the city 
ordinances is committed, continued or permitted by any such person.

6. Section 108.5, entitled "Stop work orders/' shall be amended so that the final 
sentence thereof shall read; "Any person who shall continue any work in or about the 
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that 
person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of 
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith."

7. Section 305.6. 1., entitled "Sewer depth," shall be amended to read as follows: 
Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a minimum of 
36 inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank connection. Building sewers 
shall be constructed in accordance with the requirements of Johnson County 
Wastewater.

8. Section 904. 1, entitled "Roof extension," shall be amended to read as follows:

All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated at least 18 inches 
above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for any purpose other than 
weather protection, the vent extension shall be run at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above 
the roof.

Section 11. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
FUEL GAS CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of 
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills. Kansas, that certain 
document known as the "International Fuel Gas Code" 2000 Edition, including 
Appendix Chapters A., B., and C., but excluding Appendix D., as published by the 
International Code Council, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or 
portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three 
copies of the International Fuel Gas Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as 
Adopted by Ordinance No. 197," with all sections or portions thereof intended to be 
omitted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which 
shall be attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to 
inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, 
may be on a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that any changes or 
amendments are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily 
understood. The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments 
of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of



the city, such number of official copies of such International Fuel Gas Code similarly 
marked, as may be deemed expedient.

Section 12. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE. The following sections of the 
International Fuel Gas Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted;

1. Section 101.1, entitled "Title," shall be amended to read: "These regulations 
shall be known as the International Fuel Gas Code of the City of Westwood Hills, 
Kansas, hereinafter referred to as 'this code."'

2. Section 201.3, entitled "Terms defined in other codes," shall be amended to 
read as follows: "Where terms are not defined in this code and are defined in the 1999 
National Electrical Code, International Building Code, International Fire Code, 
International Mechanical Code, or International Plumbing Code, such terms shall have 
meanings ascribed to them as in those codes."

3. Section 106.5.2, entitled "Fee schedule," shall be amended to read as follows: 
"The fees for all work pursuant to this code and the permits therefor shall be set and 
established administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the 
City and as amended."

4. Section 106.5.3., entitled "Fee refunds," shall be amended to read as follows: 
"The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy."

5. Section 108.4., entitled "Violation penalties," shall be amended to read as 
follows:

Any person who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to comply with 
any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, or repair wor1< in 
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, 
or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code shall be guilty 
of a violation of this code. In addition to any administrative remedies or other 
legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions of this 
code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be 
imprisoned not to exceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each 
person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every day during any 
portion of which any violation of any provision of the city ordinances is 
committed, continued or permitted by any such person.

6. Section 108.5 entitled "Stop work orders," shall be amended so that the final 
sentence thereof shall read: "Any person who shall continue any work 'in or about the 
structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that 
person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of 
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith."

10



Section 13. INCORPORATING THE 1999 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL 
ELECTRICAL CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of 
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
welfare within the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
document known as the "National Electrical Code" 1999 Edition, including all Appendix 
Chapters A., B., C., D., and E., as published by the National Fire Protection 
Association, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are 
hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies of the 
National Electrical Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by 
Ordinance No. 197," with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or 
changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be 
attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city clerk to be open to inspection 
and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on 
a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments 
are attached to or recorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. 
The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the city 
charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, 
such number of official copies of such National Electrical Code similarly marked, as 
may be deemed expedient.

Section 14. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 
MAINTENANCE CODE. Wherever reference is made to the International Property 
Maintenance Code in any of the aforementioned codes, there shall be substituted 
therein "all property maintenance codes of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas."

Section 15. PENALTIES. Unless a penalty provision is otherwise provided for in 
any of the above codes, in addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or 
equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions of these codes shall, 
upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be Imprisoned not to 
exceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a 
separate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any violation of 
any provision of the city ordinances is committed, continued or permitted by any such 
person.

Section 16. APPEAL; BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ESTABLISHED.

Section 1. BOARD OF CODE APPEAL 8 ESTABLISHED. There is hereby 
established and created a Westwood Hills, Kansas "Board of Code Appeals. This shall 
succeed to the duties and responsibilities of the Board of Structural Appeals previously 
established.

Section 2. SAME; MEMBERSHIP. The board shall consist of three members to 
be appointed by the mayor and with the consent of the governing body. The members 
first appointed shall serve for terms of one, two and three years. Thereafter, members 
shall be appointed for terms of three years each. Vacancies shall be filled by

11



appointments for the unexpired term. The members of the board shall serve without 
compensation. In the absence of a duly appointed Board of Code Appeals, the City 
Council shall serve as the Board of Code Appeals.

Section 3. SAME; POWERS AND DUTIES. The powers and duties of the Board 
of Code Appeals shall be in accordance with the codes adopted by reference herein.

Section 17. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainage or 
surface water requirements in the codes herein, under Federal law or regulation, or any 
other code of the City of Westwood Hills, any application for construction or additional 
development of a property which in the building official's judgment may increase storm 
water runoff and/or the possibility of erosion on adjoining properties shall require the 
submission of a site plan with provisions for the containment and/or direction of any and 
all additional runoff. All storm water runoff shall be contained or directed to a drainage 
point on the same lot or property as the development occurs. No additional runoff may 
be directed toward, or allowed to drain by lay of the land (or natural topography) on any 
adjoining property or properties. Before the final inspection approval the building official 
shall certify that drainage, storm water runoff and erosion requirements have been met.

Section 18. FEES. Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, a fee or fees 
shall be charged for any permit under any of the codes herein and shall be subject to 
the following: "The fees for all work pursuant to these codes and the permits therefor 
shall be set and established administratively-by the City according to the schedule as 
established by the City and as amended."

Section 19. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE 2000 ICC ELECTRICAL CODE 
AND SUBSTITUTING THE 1999 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE THEREFORE.
Wherever reference is made to the 2000 ICC Electrical Code in any of the 
aforementioned codes, there shall be substituted therein "the Nafional Electrical Code 
1999 Edition."

Section 20. REPEAL AND SAVINGS CLAUSE. Sections 5-101 and 5-102 of 
the Westwood Hills Municipal Code, 1994 Edition, are specifically repealed and all 
other ordinances inconsistent herewith are repealed; however the repeal of said 
ordinances does not affect any right which has accrued, and duty imposed, any penalty 
incurred, nor any proceeding commenced, under or by virtue of the ordinance repealed. 
If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance (or any code 
adopted thereby) is for any reason, held to be unconstitutional, unenforceable, or 
otherwise void, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of 
this ordinance. The City of Westwood Hills hereby declares that it would have passed 
this ordinance (or any code adopted thereby), and each section, subsection, clause or 
phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, 
sentences, clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional, unenforceable, or 
otherwise void. Further, nothing herein shall repeal or void any zoning, development, or 
land use code or practice of the City.

12



Section 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force 
from and after its publication in the official City newspaper.

PASSED by the Council the 5_ day of M c u j^  2003.

APPROVED by the Mayor t h is ^  day of l\A lU j 2003.

E. Allen Roth, Mayor

ATTEST:

awna Samuel, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

aQ^<5- fXAtuJhJL)
>nald S. Reuter 

rity Attorney

13



The Legal Record
213 E. Santa Fe, Suite 2 
Olathe, KS 66061 
(913) 780-5790

Publication Fees: $120 . 53
ORD197

CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS 
ATTN: SHAWNA SAMUEL 
2004 W 50TH
WESTWOOD HILLS, KS 662 05

Proof of Publication
STATE OF KANSAS, JOHNSON COUNTY, SS;
Maureen Gillespie, of lawful age, being first duly swom, deposes 
and says ttiat she is Legal Notices Billing Clerk of TTie Leg^ 
Record which is a newspaper printed in the State of Kansas, 
published in and of general) paid circulation on a weekly, 
monttiJy or yearly b^is in Johnson County, Kanscis, is mt a 
trade, religious or fraternal publication, is put^i^ed at least 
weekly fifty (50) times a year, has been so published 
continuously and uninterrupted in said County and State for a 
period of more than one year prior to the first publication of the 
notice attached, and has been entered at the post office as 
Periodicals Class mail matter. That a notice was published 
in all editions of the r^ular and entire issue for the following 
subject matter (also identified by the following case number, 
if any)

for consecutive week(s), as fcrilows:
ORDINANCE NO. 197--5/20/03

V
Legal,Notibes BilliBilling Clerk

Subscribed a id sworn to beforeVne on this date

. _=NNY KNIGHT 
Public - State oi Kansas

My appointment expires: January 31, 2005. $120.53



Section 1 3 : INCORPORATING THE 1999 EDfTION OF THE NATIONAL
EI.ECTRfCAt, CODE. There is hereby incorporated by reference for the purpose of 
regulating building and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
w jlfaro  wtthiri the corporate lim its of the City of Westwood HIBs, Kansas, that certain 
diicumerrt known as the "National Efectrtcal Codo** 1999 Edition, including ail Appendix 
C iapters A., B., C., D., arvj E., as published by the National Fire Protection 
A:»ociation, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are 
hureafter omitted, deleted. m odifM  or Ranged. No fewer than three copies of the 
National Electrical Code shdl be rharked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by 
Ordinance No. 197," wHh alt sections or portions thereof Intended to bo omitted or 
cl>anged dearty martced to show arty such omission or change and to which shall be 
attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city derk to t>e open to inspection 
and available to the put)ljc at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on 
a CD-ROM or In another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments 
aie attached to or recorded In such electronic format so as to t>e readily understood. 
Vte police department, municipal judge and afl administrative departments o f the city 
charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the city, 
siich number o f offldai copies of such National EJectrteal Code sim llajly marked, as 
rr ay be deemed expedient.

Section 14. DELETINO REFERENCES TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 
MAJNTENANCE CODE. Wherever referar>ce is made to the Intamatlonaf property 
Vaintenance Code in any of ttie afofementtoned codes, there shaH be substituted 
tl'eraln "all property maintenance codes of the City of Westwood Hite. Kansas."

Ssction 18, PENALTIES. Unless a penalty provision is othenvise provided for in 
a iy  o f the above codes, in addition to any adm ln is^tive remedies or other legal or 
equitable ramedles provided, any persons violating the provisions o f these codes shall, 
uaon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be im prison)^ not to 
e<ceed six months or l)e both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guttty of a 
S'Sparete offense for each and ^ r y  day during any portion of which any violation of 
a iy  provision o f the city ordinances is com m ltt^, continued or permitted by any such 
p»rson.

•s
Section 19. APPEAL: BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ESTABUSHED.

Section 1. BOARD OF CODE APPEAL S ESTABUSHED. There is hereby 
established and created a Westwood HRIs, Kansas "Board o f Code Appeato. This shall 
s jcoeed to the duSes and responsibilities o f the Board o f S truc^ral AppMte p'revkxisly 
established.

Section 2. SAME: MEMBERSHIP. The board shall corwist o f three nrterht>ers to 
be appointed by tfie  mayor and with the consent o f the governing l>ody. The members 
first apporntad shaH serve for terms o f or>e, ttvo a iv j three years. Thereafter, nwmbers 
shall be appointed for terms o f three years each. Vacancies shaft be filled by

appointments for the unexplred term. The members of the board shall serve without 
compensation. In the absence of a duly appointed Board of Code A p p ^is , the City 
C )uncil shall serve as the Board of Code Appeals.

Section 3. SAME; POWERS AND DUTIES. The powere and duties o f the Board 
01 Code Appeals shall be in accordance with the codes adopted by reference herein.

Section 17. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainage or 
surface water requirements In the code# herein, under Federal law or regulation, or any 
o^her code of the City of Westwood Hills, any application for constniction or additional 
d evelopment of a property which In the bulUirvg cffldars judgment may incraaM storm 
water ainoff and/or the possibility o f erosion on ac(joining properties shall require the 
fi'Jbmission of a site plan with provisions for th^ oontainmefft and/or drrectlon o f any and

CONTINUED FROM PRECEDING PAGE
Section 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force 

f iY im  and after its publicatton (n the ofTteiel City newBpaper.

PASSED by the Courvdl t h e ^  dey ofM a v  . 2003.

a p p r o v e d  by the Mayor t h l s ^  day of  Mav - 2003.

J9f Aliep-Roth
E. AHon Rolh. Mayor

ATTEST;

Shawna Samuel, City Cierk

yflPPROVEO AS TO FORM;

l i ' i  RonaM-5. R aiflgf__________
F .onsid S. Reuter, City Attorney



.  a i u K3 OT me city,
sifch number o f official copies of such National Eiectilcai Code sim ilaily marked, as 
rray be deemed expedient

Section 14. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 
MAINTENANCE CODE. VWierever reference is made to the Intem atlm ai Property 
Vaintenanoe Code in any o f the aforementioned codes, there shall be substituted 
theiein "all property maintenance codes of the City o f Westwood Hills. Kansas."

Section 15. P E N ^T IE S . Unless a penalty prevslon is o tfY e rv^  provided for in 
a ly  of the above codes, in addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or 
equitable remedies provided, any persons violattng the provisions o f these codes shall, 
uaon convictjon thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to 
e<ceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty o f a 
s-sparate offense for each and every day during any portion of which any violation of 
a iy  provision ofthecifyon iinancas is commitfiad, continued or permitted by any auch 
p»fson. '

Section 19. APPEAL; BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ESTABUSHED.

SecJion 1. BOARD OF CODE APPEAL S ESTABUSHEO. There is hereby 
established and created a Westwood HlPs, Kansas “Board of Code Appeals. This shall 
s J g g g ^ th e  duties and responslbUIfles o f the Board of Structural Appeals previously

Section 2. SAME; MEMBERSHIP. The board shall consist o f three memt>erB to 
be appointod by the mayor and with the consent o f the governing body. The members 
first appointed shall serve for terms of one. two and three years. Thereafter, members 
snail be appointed fo r terms o f three years each. Vaancies shall be filled

appointments for the unexplred term. The members of the board shall serve without 
a<mpensatton. In the absence o f a duly appointed Board of Code Appeals, the City 
C )undl shall serve as the Board o f Code Appeals.

Section 3. SAME; POWERS AND DUTIES. The powers and duties of the Boartl 
01 Code Appeals shall be In acoonlance with the codes adopted by reference herein.

Section 17. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainage or 
surface water requlrwnents In the codes herein, under Federal taw or regulation, or any 
o-her code of the City of Westwood Hills, any ^ip lica lion  for construction or additional 
d*»velopment of a property which in the bulidtng crfRctars judgment may inoBase storm 
water runoff and/or the possibility of erosion on ac^ioinir^ properties shall require ttie 
s'ibmission of a she plan w itti prowsions for the corrtainment and/or direction o f any and 
a I additionai runoff. All stom i water ru r» ff shall be contained or dttected to a d ra ln ^  
p 3int on the same lot or property as the developmevrt occurs. No additional o inoff may 

directed toward, or allowed to drain by lay o f the 1 ^  (or natural topography) on any 
adjoining property or p ro p e r^ . SefcHe theHhal inspection approval tfw  building offictat 
5*1811 certify that drainage, stonn water runoff and erosion requirements have been met

Section IB . FEES. Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, a fee or fees 
siia il be charged for any perfhit under any of the codes herein and shall be subject to 
tlie  following: T h e  fees for ail work pursuant to these codes and the pentilts tfierefor 
shall be set and established a d m in ls tra ^ ly  by the City according to the schedule as 
estal>lished by the City and as amended."

Sectton 10. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE 2000 ICC ELECTRICAL CODE 
AND SUBSTITUTING THE 1999 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE THEREFORE.
Wherever reference is tiiade to the 2006 ICC Electrical Code in any of the 
aforementioned codes, thsr^ ^hall be substituted therein "the National Electrical Code 
^999 Edition."

Section 20. REPEAL A jiib  SAVINGS CLAUSE. Sections 5-101 and 5-102 of 
tie  Westwood Hills Municipal Code. 1994 Edition, are specifically repealed arul all 
C'ther ordinances inconsistent herewith are repeated, however the repeal of said 
(•rdinances does not affect any hght which has accrued, and duty imposed, any penalty 
i 'icurred, nor any proceeding commenced, under or by virtue o f ttie  ordinance repealed. 
1̂ any section, subsection, sentence, dause or phrase of this ordinance (or any code 
ndo|Med thereby) is for any reason, held to be unoonstitutionat, unenforceat>(e, or 
rrtherwise void, such dedsibn shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of 
mis ordinance. The City of Westwood Hills hereby declares that It would have passed 
thb ordinance (or any code adopted tt^ereby), and each sectic^, subsection, clause'or 
phrase thersof, irrespective o f the feet that any one or more sections, subsections, 
r,entences, clauses and phrases t>e declared unconstitutional, uner^rceable, or 
ijtherwise void. Further, nothing herein shall repeal or vokJ any zoning, development, or 
!ar»d use code or practice of the City.

F.onald S. Reuter. City Attorney



Sectto fi 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force 
fnim  and after tts publication In the official City newspaper.

PASSED by the Council the 6th day ofM a v  . 2003.

APPROVED by the Mayor t h l s ^  day of May . 2003.

/a/David P. Patemon.

CONTINUED FROM PRECEDING PAGE

DavkJ F. Patzfnan. Mayor

A rTEST;

ShBllgy g r^Q fY
Siielley Gregory, City Clerk 

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

h\l Ronald S. ReuteL
Ranald S. Reuter, City Attorney

NOTICE OF ABATEMENT
First published in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

First Published in The Legal Rccord od Tuesday. Mav 20.2003 

CITY OF PRAmiE VILLAGE, KANSAS 

NOTICE OF ABATEMENT 

This is of&cial noticc thal the properties locatcd ai:

1. OP44000004 0028 -  LOT 28BLK 4 -  PllAlRIH HEIGHTS -  7908 MAPLB
2. OP4400000S0003-L O T 3 BLK5 PRADUEHEIGHTS-7911 MAPLE
3. OP55000053 0015-LOT15BLK:53-PRAI11IEV1LLAOE-3003W.70™TERR
A. OF231216 20W-BEGINCTR68™  STSW l/iW  163NLY151W llO S 156E110-4712W . 68
5. OPJ lOOOCOO OIOl -  LOT 101 -  GRANTHURST -  Va CAKT LOT -  NO ADDRESS ON 7 1 "  TCRR
6. OP250000}50009.LOT9BLK15-M EADOW LAKE-2307W .T7™ ST
7. OP44000004 0022 -  LOT 22 BLK 4 -  PRAIRIE HEIGHTS -  7940 MAPLE
B. OP42000010 0009 -  LOT » BLK 10 -  PRAIRIE FIELDS -  5809 W. 75™ ST
9. OP42000010 0011 -  LOT 11 BLK 10 -PRAflOE FIELDS -  5801 W. 75™ ST
10. OP42000012 OOOl -  LOT I BLIC 12 -  PRAIRIE pmUDS -6225 W. 76™ ST
11. O P 550000l800ll-L O T llB L K l«-F R A IR IE V lL L A G E -4407W .7l’^ST ■

Prairie Village, Kansas have weeds, grasses or other vegetation growth in violation of 
Praint Village Municipal Code, Chapter 7.17; WEEDS, GRASSES OR OTHER 
VEGETATION IN EXCESS OF EIGHT (8) INCHES.

PERSONS OWNING OR OTHERWISE IN CONTROL OF SAID PROPERTIES ARE 
HEREBY REQUIRED TO ABATE THE VIOLATION WITHIN TEN (10) DAYS 
FROM THE'DATE OF THIS NOTICE. Failure to comply with this notice wUI result in 
the City arraDging for the abatement of the violation by cutting or otherwise removing the 
vegciatioL. Any costs lo the City will be assessed against the property owner or persons 
in control of said propeity. Failure to pay within 30 days after abatement by the City will 
result in the filing of a special assessment against ihc property. No additional noticc will 
be provided before the expiration of this notice. You may request a hearing regarding this 
case by calling the Prairie Village Codes Department at 913-385-4605.

NOTICE; No fUrther notice to cut the weeds or overgrown vegetation prior to its removal 
by the City shall be given to you for the renuinder of the calendar year.
CITY OF PRWRJDE VILLAGE CODES DEPARTMENT

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BID
Firsi published in The Legal Record. Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

ADVERTISEMENT FOR BID

aled proposals for the PUBLIC SAFETY FACILITY AND CITY HALL CCTV AND 
jCESS CONTROL SYSTEMS AUDIO, VIDEO AND COMPUTER PRESENTATION 
/STEMS, in the City of Merriam, Kansas will be received from qualified bidders by the 
ty of Merriam, Kansas at 9000 West 62"'' Terrace, Merriam. Kansas 66202 until June 
), 2003 at 4;00 p.m., at vi/hich time and place all bids will be publicly opened and read.

lese projects encompass the furnishing and installation of audio, video and security 
•mponents associated with the new Public Safety Facility and renovated City Hall.

ie Project Manual, consisting of the Bidding Documents may be examined at Ihe office 
the Communily Development Director of Merriam, Kansas, 9000 West 62"'̂  Terrace, 
erriam, Kansas 66202. The Project Manual may be obtained at Shaughnessy Fickel 
Scott Architects, Inc.. 1150 Grand Boulevard, Suite 400, Kansas City, MO 64106, for 
10.00 per set (non-refundable).

ORDINANCE NO. 197
First published in The Legal Recort, Tuesday, May 20, 2003. 

CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS 

ORDINANCE NO. 197

\

ORDINANCE REGULATING BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION PRACTICES AND 
REGULATING AND CONTROLLING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALfTY OF 
MATERIAL,-ERECTION. INSTALLATION. ALTERATION. RERAIR. LOCATION. 
PELOCATION^ 'REPLACEMEhfT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF 
PROPERTY, BUILDINGS. AND STRUCTURES AND TO PROVIDE FOR SUPPLIED 
UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTMER PHYSICAL THINGS AND CO NO m O NS 
E SSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE, SANITARY, AND FIT 
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CITV OF 
V/ESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS; INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE 2000 -
EDITION OF THE IKTTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE. EXCLUDING ALL 
APPENDICES: TWE 2000 EDITION OF THE RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND 
TWO-FAMILY DWELLINGS INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B.. C., D., E., J., 
AND K-, BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS F.. G., H.. AND I.; THE 2000 
EDITION OF T>^E INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE INCLUDING APPENDIX 
CHAPTER A., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTER B.; THE 2000 EDITION OF 
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, EXCLUDING ALL APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 
2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE EXpLUDlNG ALL 
APPENDIX CHAPTERS: THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS 
CODE. INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B., AND C „ BUT EXCLUDING 
APPENDIX CHAPTER D.: AND THE 1999 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL 
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A.. 6.. C. D.. AND E.; WITH CERTAIN 
CMISSIONS, CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO AND PRESCRIBING 
ADDITIONAL REGULATIONS; PROVIDING CERTAIN PENALTIES; SUBSTITUTING 
THE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES OF THE CITY OF W ESTWOOD HILLS 
FOR THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; ESTABLISHING A 
BOARD OF CODE APPEALS, AND THE MEMBERSHIP AND PROCEDURES 
THERETO: ESTABLISHING CERTAIN STORM WATER AND DRAINAGE CONTROL 
Pf^OCEDURES: PROVIDING FOR CERTAIN FEES; ESTABLISHING THE 
APPLICABILITY OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; AND REPEALING 
CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF 
W'ESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS;

Section 1. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
BUILOINQ CODE. There is hereby Incorporated by reference for the purpose of 
regulating buDding and construction practices and to provide for the public safety end 
w-^lfare within the corporate limits o f the City o f Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
document known as the ''International BulkJlng Code” 2000 Edition, excluding all 
Ajipendlces, as published by the International Code

C ouncil, Inc., save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter 
omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies o f the International 
F uilding Code shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 
197," with all sections or portions thereof Intended to be omitted or changed clearty 
marked to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of 
tills ordinanoe, and filod with the city clerk to be open to inspection and available to the 

. p jb lic  at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in 
another electronic form, provklod that any changes or amendments are attached to or 
nicorded in such electronic format so as to be readily understood. The ^ l ic e  
d apartment, muntdpal judge arKj all administrative departments of the city charged with 
en forcem enlo fthe ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost o f the dty. such number of 
o ^ d a l copies of such International Building Code eimilarly marked, as may be deemed 
etpodient. <-

Section 2. REVISED. AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE: The following sections o f the 
International Building Code shall be re v ls ^ , amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1 shall be amended to read 'These regulations shall bo known as 
the Building Code of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas."

2. Section 101.2 shall be amended to read : "Exception: Detached one- and two- 
family dwalllnge and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three 
stories high with saparute means of egress and their accessory structures shall comply 
wrth the International Resklantlal Code as amended." .

3. S e c tio n  . 101.4.1. ahall be amended to read: T h e  provisions of the National
E ectrical Code shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, 
repairs, replacement, equipnnent appiiancas, fixtures, fittings arnj appurtenances • 
thereto." -

4. Section 105.2. entitled "Work exempt from pemnit," shall be revised to and 
amended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 13. under the sub-category 
“E uilding’ from the permit requirement The requirement fo r a permit is further set forth 
in section 5-103 of tt>e Westwood Hills Municipal Code.

5. Section 105.3.2 shall be amended to read as follows; "An application for a 
permit for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after 
the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a permit 
hns been issued; except that the building official is authorized to grant one or more 
e>1ensions of time for additional periods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension 
or extensions shall be g u e s te d  in vt/riting and justifiable cause demonstrated."

6. Section 106.3, entitled "Building pemitt valuations,'' shall be amended to add 
thd following sentence at the end of said provision: “Alternatively, buikling penriits fees

c o n tin u ed  on  n e xt  pag e



be sat and established administrstnraty by the City according to the schsdule os 
established by (he City and as amended."

‘ . 7. Section 113.4, entitled ’V iolation penaWes." shall be amended to add the
foilovMng at the end of said provision;

In addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equitable remedies 
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction 
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or bo imprisoned not to exceed 
six months or be both so fined end imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty o f a 
separata offense for each and every day during any portion of which any 
violation Of any provision o f theicity ordinances is commWed, continued or 
permitted by any such perBon.

B. Section 1612.3, entitted "Establishment of flood hazard area," shaD be 
d» ieM , and In lieu thereof, Bhall be inserted the fo llo^ng: "To establish flood hazard 
a eas, the City of Westwood Hills may adopt a flood haiard map and supporting data, tf 
and when the cFty undertakes such a task, such shall comply wfth the re q u lr^e n ts  of 
section 1812.3 and shall be Incorporated into the dty's code requirements." ’

9. Section 3408.2, enUtied "Applicability,* shall be amended so th flt the first 
s>»ntence thereof shall read: "Structures existing prior to the date o f adoption of this 
c }de. in which there is work involving additions, aftaratlons or changes of occupancy 
si'iall be made to conform to the requirements o f this section or the provisions of 
Sections 3402 through 3406." -

Section 3. INCORPORATINO THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
RESIDEN-nAL CODE FOR ONE^ND TWO-FAMILY OWELUNOS. There is hereby 

. Ircorporated by reference for the purpose of regulating building and construction 
p ectices and to provide for the public safety and welfare within the o o ^ ra te  lim its of 
ire  City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain document known as Ihe "International 
Residentiat Code for One^and Two-Family Dwellings" 2000 Edition, e i^ud ing  ^p e n d ix  
Chapters P., O., H., and I. but including Appendix Chapters A., B „ C., D., E., J., and k; 
a » published by the International Code Council. Inc.. save and exdept such arfjcles,

‘ fiction 's, parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modifi«^,or changed. t4o 
fewer than three copies of the International R e ^e n tia l Code for O f»^ and Two Family 
Dwellings shall be marked or stamped "Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance 
No. 197." with all sec^ons or portions thereof Intended to tie  om'rttod or changed ctearty 
IT adced to show any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of . 
this ordinance, and filed w ill) the city derk to be open to Inspection and available to the 
pijbiic at all reasonable hours. One such oopy. however, may be on a CD-ROM or in 
another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or 

’ recorded in such electronic fonmat so as to be readily understood. The police 
d«:partment, municipal judge and all administrative departments o f the city chaiged with 
enforcement o f the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost o f the city, such number of

'official copies of such Intemational Residential Code for One- and Two-Family 
Ciwellings similarly marked, as may be deemed exp^len t.

•T
Section 4. REVISED, AMENDED. OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 

to m O N  OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-ANO TW O - 
FAMILY DWELLINGS, The following sections of the International Residential Code for 
C>no- and Two-Family Dwellings 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted;

1. Section R101.1, entitled m ile ," shall be amended to read; These provisions ' 
shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of 
the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, and shall be cited as such and will be 
refen’Bd to herein as '(his c o d e . ^‘o.J. .
2. S o^on  R105.2, entitled "W ork exempt from peim il," shall too rofvlswl and 
amended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 9..under the sub-category 
“BuiWing* from the penult requirement. The requirement for a pem iit Is.furtherset 
forth in section 5-103 o f the Westwood Hills Municipal Code.

3. Section R305.1, entitled "M inirriiim  height," shall be a m e rrirt 'tb:amend only 
"  ttvQ first sentence thereof to read as follows; "Habitable rooms, Kaljways, obnr^oiB,

bathrooms, toilet rooms, laundry rooms and basemems'shall hava a ceiling height of 
not less than 6 feet 8 Inches." Also, the subparagraph of Section R305.1. enthied 
"î xcaptions 3.," shall be amended to nasd as follows: “Not more than o f the 
niquired floor area o f a room or space is perrnitted to have a,sloped celling less than 6 ' 
fiie t, 8 Inches in height with no portion of the required floor area less than 5 feet in 
he ighl" , ■ . •, •

4. Section R201.3. entitled Term s defined in other codes,” shall be amended (o 
mad as follows: "Whers tem is are not defined in this code and are defined In the 1099 
National Electrical Code. Intemational Building Code, Intemational Fire Code, the 
International Fuel Gas Code, or the international Mechanical Code, such terms shall 
have meanings ascribed to them as in those codes." .

5. Sectnn R108.1, entitled "Building p ^ i t  valuations," shall be amended to add 
ti-te following sentence at the end of said provision: "Altemativaly, building permits fees 
n>aybe set and established administratively by the City according to the schedule as 
e stab lish^ by the City and as amended."

6. Section R l 13.4, entitled *Vk>latlon penalties,'* shaH be amerided to add the 
fcllowing at the end of said provision;

In addition to any administratlvB remedies or other legal or equitable remedies 
provkJed, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction 
thereof, be fined In a sum not to exceed $500, or be im prison^ not to exceed 
six months or be both so fined and Imprisoned. Each person ^ a ll be guilty of a

CONTINUED FROM PRECEDING PAGE
separate offense for each and every day during any portion o f which any 
violation of any provision of the d ty  ordinances is committed, continued or 
permitted by any such person.

7.' Section 301.2, entitled "Climatic and geographic design criteiria, shall be 
anended as follows; HThe criteria herein shall be administratively established by the 
b jild ing c ^ a l  and inserted herein."

Section 6. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE, There Is hereby Incorporatod by reference for the pwrpoae of 
nigulating building and construction practices and to provkJe for the public safety arid 
welfare within the oorporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansos, that certain 
dx:um ent known as the "Intemattonal Mechanical Coda" 2000 Edition, including 
Appendix Chapter A., but excluding Appendix Chapter B., as published by the 
Iritemationa! Code Council. Inc , save and except such articles, sections, parts or 
portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or char>ged. No fewer than three 
ojp les o f tt>e Intemational Mechanical Code shall t>e marked or stamped "Ofncial Copy 

. as Adopted by Ordinance No. I 8 r  with all sections or portions thereof Intended to be 
o-nltted or changed clearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which 
s ia ll l»e attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed with the city dark to be open to 
irspoction and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, 
aiay be on a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provkJed that any changes or 
a^nendments are attached to or recorded in such electronic forniat so as to be readily 
uiderstood The police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments 
o ’ the d ty charged with enforcamerrt o f the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of 
tfie city, such number o f official copies of such International Mechanical Code similarty 
niarked, as may be deemed expedient

Section 6 R A IS E D , AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF TME INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE. The following sections of 
^•a International Mechanical Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted;

1. Section 101.1, entitled *^110," shall be amerkied to read; These regulations 
. s iia ll be known as the Mechanical Code o f the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas,

h-jrelnafler referred to as 'this code."'

2. Section 106.5.2, entitled "Fee schedule,*' shall tM amended to read as follows; 
"■■he fees lor mechanical work and the permits therefor shall be sat and established
a dministratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the City and as 
a-nended."

3. Section 106.S.3, entitled "Fee refunds," shall be amended to read as follows: 
"'''he buikiing official is authorized to establish a refund policy."

4. Section 201.3, entitled T em is defined in other oodes," shall be amended to

rnad as followc; "Where terms are not defined in this code and are used In the 
International Bulkling Code, the National Electrical Code, the International Flra Code, 
Itve International Fuel Gas Code, or the International Plumbing Code, such terms shall 
h ive meanings ascribed to them as In those codes."

5. Section 108.4, entitled 'V iolatkin penalties," shell be amended to reed as
fcHowst

Persons who shall vk>late a proviBlon o f this code or shall fail to comply with any 
o f the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, or repair mechanical 
work in violation of Uie approved oonstriicUon documents or directive o f the code 
offidal, or o f a perm it or certificate issued under the provisions o f this code shall 
be guilty of a violation of this coda. In addition to any administrative remedies or 
other legal or equitable remedial provided, any persons violating the provisions 

' of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500. 
.. .or be Impriaoned not-to exceed six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. 

Each person shall be guilty o f a separate offense for each and every day during 
any portion of which any violation o f any provision o f the city ordinances Is 

. .. committed, continued or perniWed by any such person.

6. Section 106.5, entitled "Stop work orders," shall be anwnded so that the final 
snntenoe thereof shall read r "Any person who shall continue any work in or about the 
stnjctune after having been served wtth a atop work order, except such work as that 
p îTSon is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of 
a vk)latlon of this code, and punished In aooordance herewfth.'*

. Section 7. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
F>RE CODE. There is hereby incorporated by referanco for the purpose o f regulating 
txiilding and construction practices and to provkia for the public aafiaty and welfare 
w th in the corporate llmHs o f the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain document 
known as the "International Fire Code" 2000 Editnn, excluding all Appendix Chapters, 
ai: published by the International Code Coundl, Inc., save and except such articles, 
nictions. parts or portions as ara hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No 
fewer than three copies o f ti>e Intemational Fire Coda shall be marked or stamped 
"(ffid a l Copy as Adopted by Onjinance No. 107," with all.sections or portions thereof 
intended to be omitted or changed clearty marked to show any suph omission or 
cfiange and to whk:h shall be attached a copy o f this ordinance, and filed with the city 
d  )fk  to be open to Inspection and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One 
siich copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in another electronic form, provided that 
any chartges or amendments are attached to or raconjed In such electronic format so 
as to be readily undemtood. The police department, m unidpal judge and all 
administiBtive departments of the city charged with enforcement of the ordinance shall 
bf I supplied, at the cost o f the city, such numt>er of official copies o f such International 
Fins Code similarly marked, as may be deemiad expedient.

 ...................  CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



c o n tin u e d  fh o m  pr ec ed in g  pag e

SMtlon 8. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITTON OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. The tollowlng 80C»0n& of the 
International Fire Code 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, of delated:

1. Section 101.1, entitled Tme,'* shall t>e amended to read as tellows: T hesfi 
riflu la tlons shall be known as the Intemationai Fire Code o f the City of WestWood Hills. 
Kansas, hereinafter referred to as th is code.*"

2. Section 201.3, entitled Term s defined In otfw r codes," shall be amended to 
re ad as follows: “Where terms are not defined rn this code and are defined Jn the 1999 
National Eloctrtcai Code, International Buiklino Code, the International Fuel Gas Code, 
Ir tematjonal Mechanical Code, or International Plumbing Code, such terms shall have 
n  eaninge ascribed to them as in those codes."

3. Section 105.1, entHled "Permits required," shall be amended to add a final 
fiiintenca as follovw; T h e  fees for this oode and the permits therefor shall t>e set and 
»itabllshed administrativehr by the City according to the schedule as established by the
C.ty and as amended."

4. Section 10B.3, entitled ‘ Prosecution of violations," shall be amended to add 
the following:

Ir̂  addition to any admlniatrativa rsmadies or other legal or equitable remedies 
provided, any persons violating the provlsiona of this code shall, upon conviction 
thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500, or be Imprlsortad not to exceed 
sbc months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty o f a 
separate offense for each aiid every day during any portion of which any 
violation of any provision of the city ordinanoos is committed, oontinued or 
permitted by any such person. ' .

5. Section 111.4. entitled "Failure to compty,” shall be amended to read as 
follows: “Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop 
w xk order, except such worli as that person Is directed to perform to remove a violation 
01 unsafe condition, shall be guilty of a vtolaUon o f this code, and punished In 
a<«ordance herewith."

6. Section 3406.2,4.4., entWed "Locations where above-ground tanks are 
piohibHed." shall be an>ended to read: T h e  storage o f Class t and II Hqulds In above-

 ̂ground tanks is prohibited anywt>ere In the oty, except that a permit for such tanks may 
* bit granted by the Governing Body upon good cause shown and assurances by all 

c(<mpetent sources that such tanic poses no urireasonabie threat or danger to persons 
ot property."

Section 9. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
p lu m b in g  CODE. There Is hereby Incorporated by referenoe for the purpose of

regulating bulMlng and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
wstfiare wtthin the corporate limits of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
document known as the "International Plumbing Code’  2000 Edition, excluding all 

‘Appendix Chapters, as published by the International Code Council, Inc., save and 
e:<cept such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter omittad, deleted, 
rrodrfied or changed. No fewer Ihan Jhree copies of |h© l/itemational Plumbing Code 

.shall be marked or stamped “Otndai Copy as Adopted by Ordinance.No. 197," with all 
sections Of portions thereof Intended to be omitted or changed clearly merited to show 
any such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of thte ordinance. 
ai)d filed with the city derk to be open to inspection and available to the public at all 
irasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or In another 
electronic fom>, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or recorded 
in such electronic format so as to be readily underetood. The pdioe department.
TTiunicipai judge and an administratfve departments of the city charged wtth enforcement 
ot the drdinance shall be supplied, at the cost of the dty. such number of ofRcial copies 
o*. such Intemational Plumbing Code similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient

SecUcm 10. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EOmON OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUHBINQ CODE. The following sections o f the 
Inlamatlonal Plumbing Code 2000 EdMon shall be rsvlsed, amended, or deialed:

1. Section 101.1, entitled TWe," shaB be amended to reed: These regulations 
shall be known as the International Plumbing Code of the City of Westwood Hills,
K insas, herelnaftBr referred to as th is  code." . -

2. Section 201.3, entitled Term s defined In other codes,” shall be amended to 
read as fblkiws: "Where terms are not defined in this oode and are d ^ e d  in the 1008 
National Electrical Code, IntemalionaJ BuiMrng Code; (ntematkmal Fire Code, the 
Intamatlonai Fuel Gas Code, or the Intamatlonal Mechanical Code, such terms shall 
h)ive meanings escrit>ed to them as In those codes.''

3. Section.106.6.2., entitled “Fee schedule,‘  shall be amended to read as 
fclkjws; The fees for all plumbing wortc and the permits therefor shall be set and 
etlabllshad administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by tt»
C 1y and as amended.*'

4. Section 106.6.3., entitled "Fee refurxls." shall be amended to read as follow?:
^  he building official Is authorized to establish a refund poHcy."

5. Section 108.4, entitled "Vtolatlon penalties,’* shall be amended to read as
foikMvs:

Any parson wtio shall violate a provision of this coda or shall fail to comply with 
 ̂any of the requirements thereof or who shaD erect Install, alter, or repair 
plumbing work In vlolatton of the approved corwtiuclion documents or dlracHva of

the code ofTicial, or o f a pemfiit or oertificate issued under the provisions o f this 
code Shan be guiny of a violation of this oode. In addition to any admlntstnitive 
remedies or other legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the 
provisions of this code shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to 
exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed six months or be both so fined and 
imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a separate offense for each and every 
day during any portion o f which any vk)latk>n ot any provision of the cfty 

 ̂ oniinaricee Is committed, continued or permitted by any such person.

6. Section 108.5, entitled "Stop work orders," shall be amended so that the final 
Sfintenoe thereof shall read: "Any person who shall oontlnue any work in or about the 
stucture after having been served wtth a stop work order, except such work as that 
ptirson is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe corklitlon, shall be guilty of 
a vtolatlon of this coda, and punished In accordance herewith."

7. Section 305.6.1., entitled "Sewnr depth," shall t>e amended to raad as follows: 
BuDdlng seM^ers that connect to private sewage disposal systems shall be a minimum of 
34i inches batow finished grade at ttie  point septic tank connection. Building sewers 
s lia ll be constructed in accordance with the lequlraments of Johruon County 
Wastewater. j

8. Section 904.1. entitled "Roof extension," shall be amended to read as follows.

All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall t>e terminated at least 18 inches 
above the roof, exoept that wt^ere a roof is to be used for any purpose other than 
waathar pratectton. the vent extension shall be mn at least 7 feet (2134 mm) above 
the roof.

Section 11. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EOmON OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
FUEL GAS CODE. Thera is hereby incorporated by reference for the pu^ose of 
regulating buikling and construction practices and to provide for the public safety and 
vî Mfara within the corporate lim its of tho City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
dcicument known as the "Intemattonal Fuel Gas Code" 2000 Edition. Indudlng 
Afipendbt Chapters A.. B., and C.. but exdudtng Appendbc 0., as published by the 
Intematkinal Code Council. Inc., save and exoept such a rtid w . sections, parts or 
portions as ars hereafter omitled, deleted, modiried or changed. No fewer than three 
cc'pjas o f the Intamatlonal Fuel Gas Code shall be marked or stamped "Offhial Copy as 
Arloptad by Ordinance No. 197," wtth all sections or portions theraot Intended to be 
omitted or changed dearly marked to show any such omission or change and to which 
sl-all be attached a copy o f this ordinanoe. and filed with the city derk to be open to 
in ipadion and available to the public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, 
may be on a CO*ROM or In another electronic fonnn, provided that any changes or 
arnsndments are attached to or recorded In such electronic format so as to be readily, 
understood. The police department, munidpal judge and all administrative departments 
bt the city charged wfth enforoement o f the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost of

Ui3 city, such number of offidal copies of such intemational Fuel Gas Code similarly 
marked, as may t>e deemed expediem.

Section 12. REVISED, AMENDED, OR.DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EOmON OF THE l^fTERNAT10NAL FUEL GAS CODE. The following sections o f the 
iniemdtlonal Fuel Gas Code 2000 Edftion shad be revised, amended, or deleted:

I

1. Section 101.1, entitled T itle ," shall be anr̂ ended to read: These regulations 
Bliall be known as the Intemational Fuel Gas Code of the Crty of Westwood Hills,
Kiinsas, hereinafter referred to as th is  code."'

2. Section 201.3, entitled Term s defined in other codes." shall be amended to 
read as follows: "Whera terms are not defined in this code and are defined In the 1998 
N itlonal Electrical Code, Intemational BuikJing Code, International Fire Code, 
Intemational Machanicat Code, or Intemational Plumbing Coda, such tarms shall have 
meanings ascribed to ttwm as in those codes."

3. Sectkin 106.5.2, entitled "Fee schedule," shall be amended to raad as folkiws: 
n  he fees for all work pursuant to this code and | the permtta therefor shall be set and 
eKtablished administratively by the City according to the schedule as established by the 
C'ty arid as amended.”

4. Section 106.5.3.. entitled "Fee refunds," shall be amended to read as follows: 
n h e  bulkling offidal is aumortead to establish a refund policy."

5 Section 108.4., entitled ‘V iolation penalties," shall be anwnded to read as 
follows:

Any person who shall vtolale a provision of this code or shall fail to comply wtth 
any o f the requirements thereof or who shall e rect Irutall, alter, or repair work in 
vk>lation of tt>e approved construction documents or directive of the code ofTidal, 
or of a permit or certificate Issued under the provisions of this code shall be guilty 
of a violation of this coda. In addition to any administratfve remedies or other 
legal or equitable remedies provided, any persons violating the provisions of this 
oode shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed SSOO. or be 
Imprtsonad not to exceed sbc monlhs or be both so fined and tmprisoned. Each 
person shall be guilty of a separBte offense for each and every day during any 
portion of which any violation of any provision of the city ordinances is 
committed, continued or pennitted by any auch person.

6. Sectk^n 108.5 entitled "Stop work orders," shall be annended so that the final 
8<>ntBnoe thereof shall raad: "Any person who shall continue any work *in or about the 
Bt-ucture after having been served with a stop work order, exce^ such work as that 
ptirson is directed to perform to remove a vwlatkin or unsafe condition, shall be guilty of 
a violation of this code, and punished in accordance herewith." ^

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE



' I^UW I INUhU hHUW HHbCbmNO PAGt;

S octiofi 13. INCORPORATING THE 1999 EOmON OF THE NATIONAL 
ELECTRICAL CODE. There is hereby Incorporated by refarence for the purpoae of 
rsguiating buliding and construction practices and to provide for the public salMy and ' 
wolfare within the oorporate limits of the City o f Westwood Hills, Kansas, that oertflin 
document known as the "National Electrteal Code" 1909 Edition. Including all Appendix 
C lapters A., B.. C., 0., and E., as published by the National Fira Protection 
A-isociation. Inc., save and except such artldea, sections, parts or portions as are 
hureafter omitted, detoted, modified or chartgad. No fewer than three copies of the 
N itional'EreclrtearCode shell be marked or stamped "O ffidal Copy as Adopted by 
Ordinance No. 197,” with all sections or portions thereof intended to be omitted or 
cJianfled ciearty marked to show any such omi»k>n or change and to whteh shall t)0 
attached a copy of this ordinance, and filed the ctty derfc to be open to inspection 
and available to (he public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on 
a CD-ROM o r In another electronic fonn, provided that any changes or amendments 
ate attached to or recorded in such electronic fonnat so as to be readily understood.
T 'le police department, municipal judge and all administrative departments of tfw  city 
ctiarged with enforcement of (he ordinance shali be supplied, at (he cost of the city, 
siich number o f ofHdal copies of such National EJectrtcal Code similarly marked, as 
nay be deemed expedient.

Section 14. DELETING REFERENCES TO TIIE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY 
MAJNTENANCE CODE. Wherever reference Is made to the Intemattorul Property.. 
Maintenanoe Code in any of the aforementioned codes, there shall be sut>stitutad 
tt'ereln "all property maintenance codes of the City of Westwood Hite, K answ /'

Section 15, PENALTIES. Unless a penalty provision is othenvise provided for in 
a ty of the above oodes, in addition to sny adm lr^trative rermxlias or other legal or 
equitable rentedies provided, any persons violating the provisions o f these codes shall, 
u Don convKtion thereof, be fined in a sum not to exceed $500. or be Imphsoned not to 
e<oeed cix monms or be both eo fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of.a 
S'iparate offense for eech and every day during any portion o f which any violation of 
a iy  provision o f the city onjlnancas Is committed, continued or pennitted by any such 
person.

Seotton 19. APPEAL; BOARD OF CODE APPEALS ^TA B U S H E D .

Section 1. BOARD OF CODE APPEAL S ESTABUSHED. Thera is tteieby 
establis^ied and created a Weatwood Hills, Kanaas "Board o f Code Appeals. This shall 
s jcoeed to the duties end responslbiiKles o f the Board o f Stnicturisl Appeals previousiy 
established.

Section 2. SAME; MEMBERSHIP. The board shall M nslst o f three members to 
be appointed by the mayor and with tiie  consent o f the govemlng body. The members 
first appointed shat) serve for tem is of one, two and three years. Thereafter, members 
shall be appointed for ternis of Ihrae years each. Vacanctes shall be fille d ^

appointments for the unexplred tenn. The members of the board shall serve without 
ct«npensation. In the absence of a duly appointed Board of Code Appeals, the Ctty 
C 3uncil shall serve as the Board of Code Appeals.

Section 3. SAME; POWERS AND DUTIES! The powen and duUw of the Board 
or Code Appeals shall be in accordance with the codes adopted by reference herein.

Section 17. STORM WATER RUNOFF. In addition to any other drainage or 
surface water requirements In the codes herein, under Federal law or ragulation, or any 
o her code of the C«y o( Weatwood Hills, any appUcation for constnicfion or additionAl 
d ivetopment of a property which In the buMdirig offldars Judgment may increase storm 
water runoff end/or the possibility of erosion on a<yointng properties s ^ ll raquir^ttw   ̂
fribm isslon of a sAe plan with provisions for the containment and/or direction o f any arid 
a i additional oinofT. A ll stonn water mnoff shall be contained or d ire c ts  to a drainage 
psint on t^ie same lot or property as the developiherrt occurs. No additional runoff mdy 
b3 directed toward, or allow«J to drein by lay o f the land (or natural topography) on any  ̂
adioining property or properties. Before the final Inspection approval the building official 
B'lall certify that drainage, storm water njnofT'and erosion requirementt have bM n met

Section IB. FEES. Notwithstanding any provision to the contrary, a fee or fees 
s ia li be charged for any permit under any of the codes herein and shall be subject to 
Ute following: The fees for all work pursuant to these codes and the permits therefor 
shall be set and established adrriinlstralively t>y the City according to the schedule as 
established by the City and as amended."

Sectton 19. DELETING REFERENCES TO THE 2000 ICC ELECTRICAL CODE 
IMD SUBSTITUTING THE 1999 M TIO NAL ELECTRICAL CODE THEREFORE.
Wherever reference is made to the 2000 ICC Electrfcai Code in any of the 
Fforemenitoned codes. th6i^ ^hoH be sut>stituted therein "the National EleOrical Code 
•999 Edition."

Section 20. REPEAL A f(b  SAVINGS CLAUSE. Sections 5-101 and 5-102 of 
t ie  Weshvood Hills Municipal Code. 1994 Edition, are specifically rapeaied and all 
C'ther ordinances inconsistent herewith are repealed; however the repeal o f said 
ciTdinanoes does not afTect any right which has accrued, and duty imposed, any penally 
t icurrad, nor any prooeeding commenced, under or by virtue of the ordinance repealed, 
r  any section, subsection, sentence, dause or phrase of this ordinance (or any code 
;idopted thereby) Is for any rsason, held to be unconstitutionai, unenforceable, or 
(itherwise void, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of 
this ordinance. The City of Westwood Hiils hereby declares that It would have passed 
this ordinance (or any code adopted thereby), and each section, subsection, clause or 
l>hrase thereof, in^spiscth/e o f the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, 
(-.entences, clauses and phrases be dedared unconstitutional, unenforceable, or 
otherwise void. Further, nothing herein shall repeal or void any zoning, development, or 
land use code or practice of the City.

Section 21. EFFECTIVE DATE. This ordinance shell take effiBot and bo In force 
trrim and alter Its publication In the ofRclel City newspaper.

PASSED by the Council t h e ^  day of  Mav . 2003.

APPROVED by the Mayor thl8_fifij day oTJ^eyL. 2003.

,/a/ K^ ie p  Rgth
E. Ailan Rolh, Mayor

ATTEST: 

a / Shavmp fiflm uoL
Shawno Samuel, City Clertc

APPROVED AS TO FORM.

6 / SppaM-S. Rflutgr
P.onatd S. Reuter. City Attorney

ORDINANCE NO. 1076
First publtshed in Trie Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20. 2003.

/  a r y  OF MISSION ,

ORDINANCE NO. 1076

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER XVI, ARTICLE 1, SECTION 102 
MEMBERSHIP, AND SECTION 103, TERMS OF OFFICE, OF THE CODE 
OF THE CITY OF MISSION, KANSAS IN ORDER TO ALLOW FIVE AT 
LARGE MEMBERS ON THE Cmr OF MISSION PLANNING 
COMMISSION. ,

ARTICLE 1. CnV PLANNING COMMISSION

16-102. MEMBERSHIP. The Planning Commission shall consist of nine members, one of 
^ whom may be a nonresident of the City. At least one ( I )  member she« be from eacr 
. word.and .no ward may have more than three (3) members.

16-103, TERMS OF OFFICE. The mayor, with the consent of the counclKshall appoint u 
members of the Planning Commission. Members shall be appointed for lermstof 
years each except as otherwise herein provided. Vacancies shali be flHed' :: 
appointment for the unexplred term only. The number of members may not *: 
reduced unless a vacancy exists or unless the.reduction takes effect at ttie end of 
term. Memt>era of the Planning Commission ishall be appointed at the first regu< 
meeting of the governing body in September. Members shell serve withoi 
compensation.

PASSED AND APPROVED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF MISSION,
■ KANSAS, this 14* day of May 2003.

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF MISSION, KANSAS, this 14*̂  
day of May 2003.

CITY OF MISSION

Laura L. P^IcConwdl, Mayor

ATTEST:

Cheri L. Williams, Deputy City Clerk

10

NOTICE OF HEARING
First published in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003,

NOTICE OF HEARING

The City of Leawood Planning Commissjon wilt hold a public hearing on Tuesday, June 10,20a 
at 6.00 p.m. at the Leawood City Hall, Council Chambers. 4800 Town Cenler Drive, Leawood. 
KBnaaa. to consider approval of an amendment to the Leawood Development OrtJinance on 
section 16-2-8.1, Planned Recreation.

If you require any accommodation (j e qualified interpreter, hearing assistance, etc.) in order to 
attend this meeting, plea^ notify (his office a\ 3) 339-9112 no later than AB hours p r^  to the
scheduled commencement of the meeting. '

J. Paul OuffandacK. Chairparson 
Leawood Plarining Commission

\ \ . I • r I 1 . V S.l. U



may be sat and established administrBtjvety by the CKy according to the schedule 09'  
established byr the City and as amended." /

7. Section 113.4, entitled ’Violation penalties." shall be amended to add the ^- 
inliowtng at the end of said provision:

In addition to any administrative remedies or other legal or equitable remedies 
provided, any persons violating the provisions of this code shall, upon conviction 
thereof, tie f̂ ned in a sum not to oxcoed $500, or be imprisor>ed not to exceed 
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each person shall be guilty of a 
separate offense for each end every day during any portion of which any 
violation of any provision o f the city ordinances Is committed, continued or 
pennltted by any such per6on.

8. Section 1612.3. entitled "Establishment of flood hazard area," shaQ be 
deleted, and In lieu thereof. Bhali be inserted the foRowIng: T o  establish flood hazard
a eas, the City of Westwood Hills may adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. If 
a-id when the city undertaltes such a.tasK, such shall comply with the requlren^ents of 
Section 1612.3 and shall be Incorporated into the city’s code requirements." '

9. Section M09.2, entitled ’’Applicability,* shall be amended so that the ffrst 
s->ntence thereof shall read; ’ Stnjctures existing prior to the date of adoption of this 
o d e , in which there Is work involving additions, attorations or changes of occupancy 
siiall be made to conform to the requirements of this section or the provisk}ns of 
Sections 3402 through 3408.”

Secdon 3. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EOmON OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR O NE^ND TWO-FAM(LV OWELLINQS. There is hereby 
Ir corporate by reference for the purpose of regulating building and construction 
p -actices and to provide for the public safety and welfare within the oorporate lim its of 
tt'e City of Westwood Hills, Kansas. .that certain docurT>ent1mown as the ‘ international 
Residential Code for One-and Two-Family DmDings* 2000 Edition, excluding Appendix 
Chapters F., G., H., and I. but Including Appendix Chapters A., B.. C., □., E., J., and K, 
a t published by the Intematjonal Code Council. Inc., save and except such articles, 
s ix ^ n s , parts or portions as are hereafter omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No 
fewer than three copies of the International Residential Code for One- and Tvra Family 
Owellings shall be marlted or stamped "OfTtcial Copy as Adopted by Ordinance 
Na.lST,** v/irh all sections or portions thereof Intended to be omitted or changed clearly 
rrarked to show ony such omission or change and to which shall be attached a copy of 
this ordinance, and filed w ltli uie city derlt to be open to Inspection and available to the 
public at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in 
another electronic form, provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or 
recordod in such electronic format so as to be readiV understood. The police • 
dopartment, municipal judge and all administrative departments o f the d ty charged vtnth 
enforcement o f the ordinance shall be supplied, at the cost o f the city, such number of

fftcial copies of such Internationa! Residential Code for One- and Two-Family 
iweMings similarly marked, as may be deemed expedient.

S M tion 4. REVISED, AMENDED, OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
DfTlON OF THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE-AND TW O - 
AMILY DWELLINGS. The following sections of the International Residential Code for 
>no- and Two-Family Dwellings 2000 Edition shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section R101.1, entitled T itle ," shall be amended to read: These provisions 
shall be known as the ReskJential Code for One- and Two-Family Dwellings of 
the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, and shall be cited as such and will be 
referred to herein as 'this ^ e .
I.:.
2. Section R105.2, entitled "Wor1< exemipt from perm it" shall be revised and ■ 
amended to delete the exemptions num ber^ 1. through 9. under the sub-category 
'Building* from the pemnit requirement. The'requirement for a perm it Is fu r ^ r  set 
forth in section 5-103 of the Westwood Hills Munk:lpal Coide.

3. Section R305.1, entitled "Minimum height,” shall be amended tb.amend only 
he. first sentence thereof to read as foliows: "Habitable rooms, haltways, oorridors, 
DBthrooms, toilet rooms, laundry rooms and basements shall have a ceiling height of 
iDt less than 6 feet 8 Inches.” Also, the subparagraph of Section R305.1. entitled 
‘Inceptions 3.," shall be amended to read as follows: "Not more than 50% of the 
fxfuired floor area of a room or space is permitted to have a sloped celling less than 6 
iie t 6 inches in height with no portion of the required floor area less than 5 feet in
1 eight."

4. Secbon R201.3, entitled Tem is defined in other codes," shall be amended to 
i:ad as follows; "Where terms are rw t defined in this code and are defirwd In the 1999 
vational Electrical Code, International Building Code, International Fire Code, the 
ntemational Fuel Gas Code, or the International Mechanical Code, such terms shall 
lave meonings ascribed to them as in those codes."

5. Section R108.1, entitled "Buikling pem iit vaiuaUons." shall be amended to odd 
tie  following sentence at ttM end of said provtsion: “A ltem ati^ly. building permits fees 
naybe set and established adminiGtratlvely by the City according to the schedule as 
established by the City and as amended.”

6. Section R113.4, entitled "Vk}lation penalties," shall be amended to add the 
(ilow ing at the and o f said provision:

In addition to any administrative remedies or c^her legal or equitable remedies 
provkJed, any persons violating the provisions o f this code shall, upon oonvlctlon 

'thereof, be fir> ^  in a sum not to exceed $500, or be imprisoned not to exceed 
six months or be both so fined and imprisoned. Each peru>n shall be guilty o f a

30AS :X3H^OG3Uk:iTHOO

CONTINUED FROM PRECEDING PAGE ~



ORDINANCE NO. 197
First published in The Legal Record, Tuesday, May 20, 2003.

CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS 

% ORDINANCE NO. 197

ORDINANCE REGULATING BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION PRACTICES AND 
REGULATING AND CONTROLLING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALrTY OF 
MATERIAL. ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPMR,.LOCATION.^,  ̂
r e l o c a t io n ; REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR MAINTENANCE OF 
PROPERTY, BUILDINGS, AND STRUCTURES AND TO PROVIDE FOR SUPPLIED 
UTILITIES AND FACILITIES AND OTHER PHYSICAL THINGS AND CONOmONS 
ESSENTIAL TO ENSURE THAT STRUCTURES ARE SAFE. SANITARY. AND FIT 
FOR OCCUPATION AND USE WITHIN THE CORPORATE LIMITS OF THE CtTY OF 
V/ESTWOOD HILLS, KANSAS; INCORPORATING BY REFERENCE THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE, EXCLUDING ALL 
APPENDICES; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND 
TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B.. C., D.. E., J., 
AND K., BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS F., G.. H.. AND I.; THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE INCLUDING APPENDIX 
CHAPTER A.. BUT EXCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTHR S.; THE 2000 EDITION OF 
THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE. EXCLUDING ALL APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 
2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE EXCLUDING ALL 
APPENDIX CHAPTERS; THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS 
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., S.. AND C.. BUT EXCLUDING 
APPENDIX CHAPTER D.; AND THE 1999 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL 
CODE, INCLUDING APPENDIX CHAPTERS A., B.. C. D „ AND E.; WITH CERTAIN 
CMISSIONS. CHANGES AND ADDITIONS THERETO AND PRESCRIBING 
ADDITIONAL REGULATIONS; PROVIDING CERTAIN PENALTIES; SUBSTITUTING 
THE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES OF THE CITY OF WESTWOOD HILLS 
FOR THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE; ESTABLISHING A 
BOARD OF CODE APPEALS,' ^ND THE MEMBERSHIP AND PROCEDURES 
THERETO; ESTABLISHING CERTAIN STORM WATER AND DRAINAGE CONTROL 
PROCEDURES; PROVIDING FOR CERTAIN FEES; ESTABLISHING THE 
APPLICABILITY OF THE NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; AND REPEALING 
CERTAIN SECTIONS OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE.

BE IT pRDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF 
W'ESTWOOD HILLS. KANSAS;

S flctlon 1. INCORPORATING THE 2000 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL 
BUILDING CODE. There is hereby Incorporated by reference for the purpose of 
regulating building and construction practiceft and to provide for the public &afoty and 
w-jlfare within the corporate lim te o f the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas, that certain 
document known as ttie  "International Building Code" 2000 Edition, excluding alt 
Aispendlces, as published by the International Code

C ouncil, Inc.. save and except such articles, sections, parts or portions as are hereafter 
omitted, deleted, modified or changed. No fewer than three copies o f ttie  International 
Building Code shall be marî ed or stamped “Official Copy as Adopted by Ordinance No. 
197/' with all sectlon& or portions thereof Intended to be omitted or changed clearly, 
ntarked to show any such omission or change and to which shaii be attached a copy of 
til is ordinance, and filed with the city derfc to be open to inspection and available to the 
P'jblic at all reasonable hours. One such copy, however, may be on a CD-ROM or in 
anotfier electronic fonr», provided that any changes or amendments are attached to or 
Rsconjed In such electronic format so as to t>e readily understood. The police 
d apartment, municipal judge and all administrative departments of the crty charged with 
eTfbrcoment of the ordinance shall be supplied, at the oost o f the dty, such numt>er of 
oiTldal copies of such tntemational Building Code similarty marlced, as may be deemed 
e<podlent

Section 2. REVtSED, AMENDED. OR DELETED SECTIONS OF THE 2000 
EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE: The following sections of the 

Jntemational Building Code shall be revised, amended, or deleted:

1. Section 101.1 shall bo amended to read "These regulations shall bo known as 
th e Building Code of the City of Westwood Hills, Kansas."

2. Section 101.2 shall be amended to read ; “Exception: Detached one- and two* 
f t  mily dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (townhouses) not more than three 
siories high with separate means of egress and their accessory stmctures shall comply 
with the International ResWential Code as amended."

3. Section 101.4.1. shall be amended to read: "The provisions of the National
E ectrlcal Code shall apply to the installation of electrical systems, including alterations, 
repairs, replacement, equipment appliances, fixtures, fittings and appurtenances 
thereto."

4. Section 105.2. entitled "Wortt exempt from penmit," shall be revised to and 
amended to delete the exemptions numbered 1. through 13. under the sub-category 
“E uildtng' from the permit requirement The requirement for a permit is further set forth 
In section 5-103 of ttie  Westwood Hills Municipal Code.

5. Section 105.3.2 shall bo amended to read as follows: "An application for a 
punntt for any proposed work shall be deemed to have been abandoned 180 days after 
the date of filing, unless such application has been pursued in good faith or a pennlt 
hds boon Issued; except that the building oftlclat is authorized to grant one or more 
e>tBnalons of time for additional f^riods not exceeding 180 days each. The extension 
or extensions shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated."

6. Section 108.3, entitled "Building permit valuations," shall be amended to add 
th9 following sentence at the end o f said provision; "AHematlvely, building permits fees

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE




